
 Retail Sale 2024

Larger Plants 3 for $39.99                                  Container sizes

Rhodos   - $29.99 each                                      005  =  5cm pot            175  =  2.5 litre pot

Smaller Plants 3 for $26.00                              007  =  7cm pot                6  =  6 litre pot

Baby Shrubs  -  10 for $35.00                               9  =  9cm pot              25  =  25 litre pot

Perennials  -  3 for $26.00                                   Olv  =  1 litre pot       250  = 7.5 litre pot

Small Trees - $24.99                                           120  = 1 litre pot

Tall Trees - 2 for $125.00                                    140  = 1.5 litre pot

Plants can be freighted to you, email or phone for a quote.  

ph 03 2048250

Email  info@bmn.co.nz

Stock NameStock Code Container

Baby Shrubs
Acaena inermis PurpureaACAE PUR 007 007

A creeping native ground cover for a sunny garden. Red to pink flowers in 
summer. Purple to green foliage. Flat growing. Very attractive especially in 
winter. Evergreen.

Acaena novae-zelandiaeACAE NOV 007 007

A neat compact ground cover.  Bronze leaves make a great display in a sunny 
site.

Apodasmia similis1 APOD SIMI 005 005

The upright formal appearance and distinctive foliage combine to make this a 
striking plant, good planted in groups. Naturally grows in wet conditions, but will 
tolerate dry soils.

Aristotelia serrataARIS SER 007 007

A quick growing small native tree useful for the background shelter. Female 
plants have berries in autumn which the birds enjoy.

Astelia fragrans WestlandASTE WES 007 007

Red brown foliage all year on a flax like clump for a semi shaded damp garden. 
Ht.1m. Evergreen. Native.

Atherosperma moschatumATHE MOS 007 007

Small Tasmanian tree, with fragrant cream flowers in summer. Ht 4m. 
Evergreen.

Austroderia richardii (Cortaderia richardii)AUST RIC 007 007

Feather-like flowers November to January. Hardy. Native. Ht 2m. Evergreen.

Bergenia Wanaka SnowBERG WANS 007 007

Hardy ground cover plant with white flowers in spring maturing to blush pink .
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Stock NameStock Code Container

Buxus microphylla var koreanaBUXU KOR 007 007

A dwarf variety differing in its spreading habit and dark green leaves. Ht 50cm. 
Origin Korea

Buxus sempervirens NotataBUXU NOT 007 007

This is the main form planted for excellent edging box. The most frequently 
used Box for hedging since its introduction to NZ by the missionaries in 1830. 
Ht 75cm. Evergreen.

Buxus sempervirens SuffruticosaBUXU SUF 007 007

Dense mass of small dark green leaves bronzing in winter. Used for small 
formal hedges. Ht.50cm. Evergreen.

Carex lessonianaCARE LES 007 007

A robust sedge growing to 1m with wide green leaves and flowering stems. 
This tussock can form colonies.

Carex sectaCARE SEC 007 007

A handsome clump forming green grass. Seed heads dark brown. Likes damp 
sites. Ht. 1m.

Carex testaceaCARE TES 007 007

Bronze and green native grass. Best planted in clumps. The form we grow has 
beautiful orange foliage.

Carex virgataCARE VIR 007 007

Dark green arching grass for a swampy area.  A good plant for waterside area 
and very damp soils.  Growing to about 90cm

Carpodetus serratusCARPO SER 007 007

Dark green leaves with light marbling on surface. Masses of small white flowers 
cover tree. Very hardy and reasonably quick growing. Ht 4m. Evergreen.

Clematis montana FredaCLEM FRE 007 007

Deep pink flowers in spring. Attractive bronze new foliage. More compact 
growing than other Clematis montana cultivars.  Very hardy. Ht 3m. Deciduous.

Clematis montana Persian FragranceCLEM PER 005 005

Masses of white flowers in spring. Very hardy climber. Ht 3m. Deciduous

Clematis montana SnowflakeCLEM SNO 007 007

Masses of white flowers in spring. Very hardy climber. Ht 3m. Deciduous

Coprosma Black CloudCOPR BLA 007 007

A compact native evergreen for sun or semi shade. All year round ebony black 
foliage. A good ground cover for the native garden. 1m spread.

Coprosma Flat FredCOPR FLA 007 007

Spreading native plant with attractive transperant grey/blue berries.

Coprosma Red RockCOPR RED 005 007

Excellent ground cover of fine red leaves and stems. Hardy attractive mound.

Coprosma rugosa Clearwater GoldCOPR CLE 007 007

Upright growing hardy native for the open garden. Very hardy with a golden hue 
to the new growth. Ht 2m. Evergreen.

Coprosma rugosa LobsterCOPR LOB 007 007

A hardy native with red stems on the new growths. Can be trimmed into a low 
hedge. Ht 1.5m

Cordyline australis x obtecta Green GoddessCORD AUSG 007 007

A dwarf form of our native cabbage tree. Leaves are a bit wider than normal 
and a lime green colour. Forms multiple heads and make a great display in 
pots and in the garden. Ht 1m

Wednesday, 20 March 2024 Page 2 of 44



Stock NameStock Code Container

Cornus kousa XanthocarpaCORN XAN 007 007

Selection with yellow instead of red fruits.  An upright bushy small tree or large 
shrub with white/cream flowers. Leaves are light green turning yellow in 
Autumn. Birds enjoy fruit (strawberries).  Ht 2.5m

Corokia variegated ( J McLareen Sport)CORO VAJM 007 007

Small shrub with green leaves variegated with yellow edges.

Corokia virgata Frosted ChocolateCORO FRO 007 007

Plant in a warm sunny garden  for best bronze colour.  An attractive native.  
Evergreen.  Ht. 1.5m.

Cortaderia toitoiCORT TOI 007 007

Largest endemic grass found in NZ Feather-like flower heads up to 2m high 
produced from November to March. Very hardy. Ht 2m. Evergreen.

Dacrycarpus dacrydiodesDACR DAC 005 005

A slow growing native, with brown foliage on the juvenile tree, changing to 
green as it gets older.Tolerates wet conditions.Ht 20m

Elaeagnus x ebbingeiELAE EBB 007 007

Hardy fast growing upright shrub with large silvery green leaves. Highly scented 
flowers in autumn/early winter. Great for hedging in sun or shade. Wind, cold & 
salt tolerant. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen

Elaeocarpus hookerianusELAE HOO 005 005

An interesting native with juvenille and adult foliage, when mature masses of 
dainty white flowers enhance this tree. Hardy. Ht. 3m. Evergreen.

Euryops virgineus GlittersEURY VGL 007 007

Small vigorous shrub with bright green leaves and yellow glittering flowers.

Gaultheria Davis WhiteGAUL DAV 007 007

Large white berries in autumn. Hardy small leaved shrub. Ht 1m. Evergreen.

Gaultheria mucronata Rubies 'n' PearlsGAUL RUBP 007 007

Blue Mt seedling with lovely big ruby coloured fruit

Grevillea AudreyGREV AUD 007 007

Orange red flowers in late winter on an upright bush for a sunny position. Ht. 
1.5m. Evergreen.

Grevillea victoriae MiquelianaGREV VICM 007 007

Drooping heads of rusty red flowers in winter. Light to medium soil. Prune lightly 
each year to keep bushy. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen.

Griselinia littoralis CanterburyGRIS LITC 007 007

Shiny smaller pointed green, attractive foliage. Ideal specimen for hedging. 
Very hardy. Ht 2m. Evergreen. Native.

Gypsophila Bristol FairyGYPS FAI 007 007

Highly sought after cut flower.Double white flowers in summer.Plant in a sunny 
position.Ht 1m. Deciduous.

Hebe annulataHEBE ANN 005 007

A dwarf compact bright green mound of whipcord foliage. Native. Ht 30cm. 
Evergreen.

Hebe Blush PinkHEBE BLUS 007 007

Blush pink flowers in Spring (Evergreen)

Hebe decumbensHEBE DEC 007 007

A low spreading native with white flowers in summer. Hardy. Ht 45cm 
Evergreen.

Hebe Deep VioletHEBE DEV 005 007

A Franciscana type with Deep violet flower in summer and green leaves all 
year. Ht. 1m. Evergreen.
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Hebe Deep VioletHEBE DEV 007 007

A Franciscana type with Deep violet flower in summer and green leaves all 
year. Ht. 1m. Evergreen.

Hebe diosmifoliaHEBE DIO 007 007

Native shrub with green leaves all year. Compact hardy bush. Ht.1m. 
Evergreen.

Hebe Doubtful SoundHEBE DOU 007 007

Fine pointed green leaves on a rounded bush. Flowers white in summer. Ht. 
1m. Evergreen.

Hebe elliptica Tiwai PointHEBE TIW 007 007

Low rounded plant  with white flowers, suitable for the coast.  Ht 1m

Hebe Emerald GemHEBE EME 005 007

A rounded bush of bright green whipcord foliage. Very hardy. Native. Ht 30cm. 
Evergreen.

Hebe Emerald GemHEBE EME 007 007

A rounded bush of bright green whipcord foliage. Very hardy. Native. Ht 30cm. 
Evergreen.

Hebe La SeduisanteHEBE LAS 007 007

Dark reddish green leaves and purple flowers make this a popular native. 
Summer flowering. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen

Hebe odora AnomalaHEBE ANO 005 007

New growths purplish turning green with age. Flowers white in summer. Very 
hardy native. Best in sun.Trim regulary to maintain bushy habit & best colour. 
Ht 60cm. Evergreen.

Hebe odora buxifoliaHEBE BUX 005 007

Small polished green leaves forming a rounded bush. White flowers. Native. 
Hardy. Ht 60cm. Evergreen.

Hebe Oratia BeautyHEBE ORA 007 007

Compact growing deep green native shrub with pink flowers fading to white in 
summer. Ht 75cm. Evergreen.

Hebe pinquifoliaHEBE PIN 007 007

Handsome glaucous foliage. A low growing native. White flowers in summer 
autumn. Hardy. Ht. 20cm. Evergreen.

Hebe pinquifolia PageiHEBE PIN PAG00 007

A low growing, evergreen shrub with grey foliage.  White flowers in late 
November/early December

Hebe Red EdgeHEBE RED 007 007

Small grey leaves edged deepest red colour in winter. Soft lavender blue 
flowers in summer.  A compact low growing native. Likes an open garden. Ht. 
60cm.

Hebe rigidula SnowdriftHEBE SNOW 007 007

Compact flowering native for sun or part shade. Long spikes of white flowers all 
summer. Ht. 1.2m. Evergreen.

Hebe salicifolia Jackson's BayHEBE SALJ 007 007

Good form found on the west coast.

Hebe SutherlandiiHEBE SUT 007 007

Pale grey green rounded leaves on a compact dwarf native bush. Hardy. Ht. 
75cm. Evergreen.

Hebe townsoniiHEBE TOW 007 007

A hardy native with white flowers in spring. Plant in sun. Ht 40cm. Evergreen.
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Heuchera AmethystHEUC AME 007 007

Red purple leaves all summer. Makes an attractive ground cover or garden 
edge.

Heuchera Lime MarmaladeHEUC LEMM 007 007

Clear lime green leaves, great ground cover for lightly shaded garden

Heuchera micrantha Peach CrispHEUC PEA 007 007

Highly filled peach pink coloured from of the very popular heuchera.  A great 
plant for a shaded area.

Hydrangea arborescens AnnabellHYDR ANN 007 007

White heads of flowers in late summer to autumn. Best in some shade. 
Ht.1.5m. Deciduous.

Hydrangea paniculata KyushuHYDR PAN 007 007

Dainty, long panicles of creamy white flowers in summer, fading to a dusty pink. 
Later and more erect flower heads than H. p. Grandiflora. Hardy. Ht: 1.5m. 
Deciduous. AGM

Hydrangea quercifolia Snow FlakeHYDR QSNO 007 007

Large bold leaves turn red in autumn. Double white flowers in summer. Plant in 
shade. Ht 1m. Deciduous.

Ilex x altaclerensis HendersoniiILEX HEN 007 007

Outstanding spineless shrub with brilliant berries and green foliage. Ht 2m. 
Evergreen. Female.

Ilex x meserveae Blue PrinceILEX MESP 007 007

Slow growing and compact bush with purple stems in winter. Male. Ht. 2m. 
Evergreen.

Kunzea ericoidesKUNZ ERI 007 007

NZ Native colonizing species . Great for shelter . 3M

Leptospermum LanigerumLEPT LAN 007 007

Evergreen shrub grows up to 4m.  Large spreading shrub.  Hardy.

Libertia grandifloraLIBE GRA 007 007

Light gold spikes all year round. Hardy native for a moist or shaded position. Ht 
75cm. Evergreen.

Libertia ixiodesLIBE IXI 007 007

Bright golden spikes make for winter colour and sprays of white flowers in early 
summers give interest all year around. Hardy native. Ht. 50cm.

Myrtus apiculata (syn. Luma apiculata)MYRT API 007 007

Bronze green leaves on compact tall shrub with beautiful bronze trunk. White 
flowers in summer. Ht 3m. Evergreen.

Myrtus KathrynMYRT KAT 005 007

NZ native shrub with oval leaves in deep red. Excellent for flower arranging. Ht 
2m. Evergreen.

Nothofagus menziesiiNOTH MEN 005 005

This NZ Native beech has very fine dark green double-toothed leaves. Ht 5m. 
Evergreen.

Nothofagus solandriNOTH SOL 005 005

Tall slender medium size evergreen tree with ascending fanlike branches. 
Native. Ht 6m. Evergreen.

Nothofagus solandri cliffortioidesNOTH CLI 005 005

Mountain Beech .Slender medium size evergreen tree with ascending fanlike 
branches. Native. Ht 6m. Evergreen.

Nothofagus truncataNOTH TRU 005 005

Large native tree for the back of the garden. Likes woodland conditions. Ht. 4m. 
Evergreen.
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Olearia lineataOLEA LIN 007 007

NZ native plant slender angular branches

Olearia lineata DartoniiOLEA LIND 007 007

Hardy native bush . Grey foliage. Will stand wind. Ht 2m. Evergreen.

Olearia odorataOLEA ODO 007 007

Bushy shrub with many erect reddish twigs bearing pale narrow oval leaves that 
are white underneath inhabiting open areas east of Main Divide. Ht 1.5m

Olearia paniculata Kaikoura CrinkleyOLEA KAI 007 007

Hardy and tolerant of coastal conditions. White flowers in summer. Evergreen. 
Ht. 2m.

Olearia traversii Chatham IslandOLEA TRAC 007 007

A rapidly growing native shrub used for shelter. Will stand salt winds. Ht. 2m. 
Evergreen.

Parahebe catarractae BluePARA CAT 007 007

A flat growing native with blue flowers in summer for a moist garden. Evergreen.

Phyllocladus alpinusPHYL ALP 005 005

A hardy slow growing native with unusual foliage. A good garden plant. Ht.2m. 
Native conifer. Evergreen.

Pimelia AridulaPIME ARD 007 007

Hybrid Pimelia.  Vigourous spreading ground cover.  Masses of white flowers in 
summer with red fruit.  Very hardy.

Pimelia prostrata Anatoki BluePIME ANA 005 007

Flat growing hardy ground cover with grey foliage for the rock garden or front of 
the shrub border.. White flowers in summer. Evergreen.

Pittosporum Ian Spence SportPITT IAN 007 007

Pittosporum t. ElizabethPITT ELI 007 007

Large cream edged leaves blushed Pink brighter in winter  on a hardy 
evergreen bush. Ideal for speciman shrub , shelter hedge, and for cut folliage. 
1.5 to 2m

Pittosporum ten Lighten UpPITT LUP 007 007

NEW 2020. Delightful, fine, confetti foliaged matapo with gold centred deep 
green leaves. Developed in Central Otago as one of the hardiest pittosporums. 
Forms an amazing narrow hedge. Ht 1.5m

Pittosporum tenuifoliumPITT TEN 007 007

Delightful small tree. Slender shape and pyramidal form. Fragrant flowers. Can 
be trimmed to any desirable size. Ht 3m. Evergreen. Native.

Podocarpus totaraPODO TOT 005 005

A tall but slow growing tree. Leaves yellowish-green, stiff and sharply 
pointed.Trims well.  Native. Ht 5m. Evergreen.

Podocarpus totara Wanaka BlackPODO TOTW 007 007

A tall slow growing tree.  Leaves brownish black, stiff and sharply pointed.  
Native. Ht 5m Evergreen

Prumnopitys ferrugineaPRUM FER 005 005

A handsome native with yew-like foliage and graceful branches. Very hardy. Ht. 
3m.. Evergreen.

Pseudopanax crassifoliusPSEU CRA 005 005

Juvenile stage could last up to 15 years, then develops a rounded bushy head. 
Good tub plant. Native. Ht 5m. Evergreen.

Sarcococca ruscifolia var ChinensisSARC RUS 005 005

Masses of large crimson berries. Makes excellent tub plant or shrub for shady 
areas. Very hardy. Ht 1m. Evergreen.
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Sophora chathamicaSOPH CHA 007 007

A large shrub or small tree with masses of rich yellow flowers. Juvenile plants 
are dense and twiggy. Finest native flowering tree. Ht 2.5m. Evergreen.

Sophora longicarinata Stock 3SOPH LON STO 007

Sophora Mangaohane Station River No 2SOPH MAN STA 007

Sophora microphyllaSOPH MIC 007 007

A large shrub or small tree with masses of rich yellow flowers. Juvenile plants 
can be dense and twiggy. Finest native flowering tree. Ht 2.5m. Evergreen.

Sophora molleyi My Margaret Whiskey Gully roadSOPH MOL MY 0 007

Sophora tetrapteraSOPH TET 007 007

A large shrub or small tree with spreading or drooping branches. Yellow pea 
shaped flowers 4-5cm long. Ht 3m. Evergreen. Native.

Sophora tetraptera ex Cromwell Motorsport ParkSOPH TET CRO 0 007

Sophora tetraptera OamaruSOPH TET OAM 007

Sophora tetraptera Tapanui Upright FormSOPH TET TAP U 007

Sophora tetraptera x chathamica Lois ThompsonSOPH TET X CHA 007

Uncinia  uncinataUNCI UNI 007 007

Densely tufted, evergreen perennial. Our form has brown to red-brown leaves, 
with dark brown flowers mid to late summer. Plant in moist, well drained soil out 
of the hot midday sun.Ht. 25cm

Viburnum opulus  XanthocarpumVIBU XAN 007 007

Clear golden yellow fruits in autumn on a compact hardy easily grown bush. 
Prune in winter. Ht.2m. Deciduous.

Viburnum opulus Notcutt's VarietyVIBU NOT 007 007

Large white flower heads on a very hardy bush in late spring/early summer. 
Glistening red fruits form in autumn and last well into the winter.  Ht. 1.5m. 
Deciduous.

Viburnum opulus Sterile syn. V.o. RoseumVIBU STE 007 007

Very hardy shrub with large white ball shaped flowers in spring. Ht 2m. 
Deciduous.

Viburnum plicatumVIBU PLI 007 007

Very hardy spreading shrub with white pompom flowers in spring. Good autumn 
colour. Ht 1.5m. Deciduous.

Viburnum plicatum tomentosum MariesiiVIBU MAR 007 007

Creamy white flowers produced abundantly in early summer along the upper 
sides of the branches giving a snow covered appearance. Ht 2m. Deciduous.

Viburnum plicatum tomentosum Summer SnowflakeVIBU SUM 007 007

White flowers produced abundantly in early summer along the upper sides of 
the branches giving a snow covered appearance. Ht 1.5m. Semi evergreen.

Larger Plants
Abelia grandiflora AlbaABEL GAL 175 175

Masses of white flowers in summer on a compact bush. New growths bronze. 
Ht.1.5m. Evergreen.

Abelia x grandifloraABEL GRA 175 175

Pale pink flowers all summer on a tidy bush of attractive foliage. Plant in a 
sunny position. Ht. 1.5-2 m. Evergreen.

Acaena inermis PurpureaACAE PUR 140 140

A creeping native ground cover for a sunny garden. Red to pink flowers in 
summer. Purple to green foliage. Flat growing. Very attractive especially in 
winter. Evergreen.
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Apodasmia similisAPOD SIMI 175 175

The upright formal appearance and distinctive foliage combine to make this a 
striking plant, good planted in groups. Naturally grows in wet conditions, but will 
tolerate dry soils.

Aucuba japonica MarginataAUCU MAR 175 175

Compact shrub for a shaded garden. Large dark green leaves with a serrated 
edge and red berries in autumn. Will stand a moist soil. Ht. 2m. Evergreen.

Azalea AbundanceAZAL ABU 175 175

Bright red flowers long season best in semi -shade  peaty soil acid fert water 
and mulch in summer

Azalea Gumpo SalmonAZAL GUMS 175 175

Dwarf compact evergreen azalea with large Salmon pink flowers.

Azalea Mrs Kint (White)AZAL MRSW 175 175

Very eye-catching Azalea with single pure white flowers in spring.  Forms a 
compact, small leaved shrub.  40cm.  Prefers cool, moist position free from 
lime.

Azalea Satsuki OrangeAZAL SAO 175 175

Lovely small Orange Evergreen Azalea

Azalea Satsuki Pink/White PicoteeAZAL SATP 175 175

Azara microphyllaAZAR MIC 175 175

Upright tree of green foliage and chocolate scented flowers in summer. Ht 3m. 
Evergreen.

Buddleja fallowiana AlbaBUDD ALB 175 175

Foliage silvery grey when young. Scented flowers of white in summer. Hardy. 
Ht. 2m. Prune after flowering. Deciduous.

Buddleja globosaBUDD GLO 175 175

Striking erect, fast growing shrub. Orange-yellow ball-like flowers in early 
summer. Prefers full sun. Hardy. Ht 3m. Evergreen.

Buddleja globosa Lime GlowBUDD GLOL 175 175

Hardy shrub with lovely pom pom flowers of a lime green.

Buddleja LochinchBUDD LOC 175 175

Foliage silvery grey when young. Scented flowers of violet blue in summer. 
Quick growing shrub, great for new gardens. Hardy. Ht. 2m. Prune after 
flowering. Deciduous.

Callistemon rigidusCALLRIG 175 175

Calluna Sister AnneCALL SIS 175 175

Small Heather with grey foliage and pink flowers in summer. Hardy. Plant in 
sun. Ht. Flat. Evergreen.

Carex virgataCARE VIR 175 175

Dark green arching grass for a swampy area.  A good plant for waterside area 
and very damp soils.  Growing to about 90cm

Cham. law. ForsteckensisCHAM LFO 175 175

Small, slow-growing conifer with dense grey-blue foliage. Hardy. Ht 1m. 
Evergreen.

Cham. lawsoniana Blue MountainCHAM LBL 175 175

A neat conical conifer of very blue foliage all year. Ideal for formal planting.  Ht. 
1.5m. Evergreen.

Cham. thyoides EricoidesCHAM TER 175 175

A compact conifer with blue green foliage in summer turning plum in winter. 
Very hardy. Ht. 2m. Evergreen.
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Choisya Aztec PearlCHOI AZT 175 175

Pink buds open white with narrow leaves on a compact bush of green. Ht 1.5m. 
Evergreen.

Choisya ternata SundanceCHOI SUN 175 175

A very neat compact shrub with golden foliage. In spring the bush is covered in 
white orange blossom-like scented flowers. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen.

Coprosma Black CloudCOPR BLA 175 175

A compact native evergreen for sun or semi shade. All year round ebony black 
foliage. A good ground cover for the native garden. 1m spread.

Coprosma Clearwater GoldCOPR CLE 175 175

Upright growing hardy native for the open garden. Very hardy with a golden hue 
to the new growth. Ht 2m. Evergreen. Male

Coprosma Flat FredCOPR FLF 175 175

Spreading native plant with attractive transperant grey/blue berries.

Coprosma RubraCOPR RUB 175 175

Rare small bushy shrub with reddish bark and fuzzy twigs.  Attractive to birds, 
evergreen, frost tollerant, Height 2m.  Full Sun.

Coprosma rugosa LobsterCOPR LOB 175 175

A hardy native with red stems on the new growths. Can be trimmed into a low 
hedge. Ht 1.5m

Cordyline a. Purple TowerCORDY PURT 17 175

New Zealands hardy palm with creamy white scented summer flowers. The 
darkest of purple foliage. Ht 3m. Evergreen.

Cordyline australis KirkiiCORD AUS KIR 1 175

Compact and neat growth habit. Considered a dwarf Cabbage Tree. Features 
bright, mid-green, strappy foliage. H: 1m

Cordyline australis x obtecta Green GoddessCORD AUSG 175 175

A dwarf form of our native cabbage tree. Leaves are a bit wider than normal 
and a lime green colour. Forms multiple heads and make a great display in 
pots and in the garden. Ht 1m

Cornus alba SibiricaCORN ALB 175 175

Very hardy, bushy shrub with bright red stems in winter, and deep burgundy red 
autumn colour. Ht 2m. Deciduous. AGM

Cornus GreenvaleCORN GRE 175 175

A vigorous tree with large creamy white flowers in early summer. In our trials of 
hardy dogwoods this tree has out performed all others. Raised in Greenvale by 
Mrs L Paterson. New 2004. Evergreen with some autumn colour as well. PVR

Corokia CloverCORO CLO 175 175

Clover - green foliage.  Ideal for clipping.  Hardy.  Height 1.5m  New Zealand 
Native.

Corokia cotoneaster Little PrinceCORO LIT 175 175

A very hardy native with masses of fine branches showing young and adult at 
the same time. Ht. 2m. Evergreen.

Corokia virgata Frosted ChocolateCORO FRO 175 175

Plant in a warm sunny garden  for best bronze colour.  An attractive native.  
Evergreen.  Ht. 1.5m.

Corokia virgata Frosted Chocolate SportCORO VFRS 175 175

Columnar habit with silvery chocolate folliage and starry yellow flowers.

Correa reflexaCORR REF 175 175

An attractive upright shrub with small neat leaves and pendant clusters of pink, 
red, and green flowers. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen.
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Cotoneaster salicifoliusCOTO SAL 175 175

A medium sized semi evergreen shrub with orange red berries in autumn. 
Hardy. Ht. 1m.

Dodonaea viscosa PurpureaDODO PUR 175 175

A quick growing native shrub. Suitable for coastal areas. Leaves red in summer 
turning rich purple red in winter. Ht 5m. Evergreen.

Drimys winteriDRIM WIN 175 175

A handsome large shrub or small tree with cream scented flowers in spring. 
Shelter from wind. Ht. 3m. Evergreen.

Elaeagnus x ebbingeiELAE EBB 6 6

Hardy fast growing upright shrub with large silvery green leaves. Highly scented 
flowers in autumn/early winter. Great for hedging in sun or shade. Wind, cold & 
salt tolerant. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen

Erica erigena AlbaERIC EAL 175 175

Green foliage and white flowers make a striking contrast in winter. Very hardy. 
Ht 50cm. Evergreen.

Erica erigena Golden LadyERIC GOLA 175 175

Bright gold foliage all year with white flowers in winter. Hardy and compact. NO 
LIME. Ht 30cm. Evergreen.

Erica erigena RosslareERIC ROS 175 175

An abundance of light purple pink flowers in late winter on an upright bush. NO 
LIME. Hardy. Ht 50cm.

Erica stuartii Irish LemonERIC SILE 175 175

 Large Mauve flowers.Green foliage with brillant lemon-yellow new growth in 
spring which persists until after flowering starts. Neat round habit. Height 21-
25cm and spread 46-60cm

Erica vagans FiddlestoneERIC VFID 175 175

Deep cerise pink flowers in summer. Very hardy. Likes peat.Prune after 
flowering. Ht 40cm. Evergreen.

Erica vagans LavenderERIC LAV 175 175

Lavender heads of flowers in summer. Very hardy. NO LIME. Ht. 50cm. 
Evergreen.

Erica vagans St KeverneERIC VSTK 175 175

Soft pink flowers all summer. Plant in a open sunny garden. NO LIME. Ht 
50cm. Evergreen.

Erica x darleyensis Mary HelenERIC MARH 175 175

Pink flowers in late winter. Hardy compact gold foliage. Ht. 25cm

Escallonia x Exoniensis (White Profusion)ESCA EXO 175 175

Also known as 'White Profusion'. A vigorous hardy shrub with white, sometimes 
blush pink flowers in summer.This is the popular white form used in hedging. 
Ht. 2m. Evergreen.

Eucryphia mooreiEUCR MOO 175 175

A rare small tree with white flowers in summer/autumn. Shelter from wind. 
Ht.3m. Evergreen.

Furcraea bedinghausiiFURC BED 175 175

A striking plant for a dry sunny garden. Tall stems of green flowers. Evergreen.

Gaultheria mucronata Davis WhiteGAUL DAV 175 175

Large white berries in autumn. Hardy small leaved shrub. Ht 1m. Evergreen.

Gaultheria mucronata Rubies 'n' PearlsGAUL RUBP 175 175

Blue Mt seedling with lovely big ruby coloured fruit
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Genista lydiaGENI LYD 175 175

Slender pendulous branches covered in late spring with yellow flowers. Very 
hardy. Ht. 50cm. Evergreen.

Griselinia littoralis CanterburyGRIS LITC 6 6

Shiny smaller pointed green, attractive foliage. Ideal specimen for hedging. 
Very hardy. Ht 2m. Evergreen. Native.

Hebe diosmifoliaHEBE DIO 175 175

Native shrub with green leaves all year. Compact hardy bush. Ht.1m. 
Evergreen.

Hebe Doubtful SoundHEBE DOU 175 175

Fine pointed green leaves on a rounded bush. Flowers white in summer. Ht. 
1m. Evergreen.

Hebe odora buxifoliaHEBE BUX 175 175

Small polished green leaves forming a rounded bush. White flowers. Native. 
Hardy. Ht 60cm. Evergreen.

Hebe rigidula SnowdriftHEBE SNO 175 175

Compact flowering native for sun or part shade. Long spikes of white flowers all 
summer. Ht. 1.2m. Evergreen.

Hebe salicifolia Jackson's BayHEBE SALJ 175 175

Good form found on the west coast.

Hydrangea arborescens AnnabellHYDR ANN 175 175

White heads of flowers in late summer to autumn. Best in some shade. 
Ht.1.5m. Deciduous.

Hydrangea mac SensationHYDR SEN 6 6

Large leaved plant with variegated flowers blue with heavy white edge.

Hydrangea macrophylla AyeshaHYDR AYE 6 6

Bold leaves with flattened dense heads of pale pink scented flowers in summer. 
Ht. 1.5m. Deciduous.

Hydrangea macrophylla Blue PrinceHYDR BLUP 6 6

Blue flowers in summer on a medium growing bush. Prune in spring. Ht. 1.5m. 
Deciduous.

Hydrangea macrophylla BluewaveHYDR BLU 6 6

Compact growing with large flattened heads of blue flowers in summer. 
Ht.1.5m. Deciduous.

Hydrangea macrophylla BodenseeHYDR BOD 6 6

Pink flowers in summer. Plant in shade. Prune after flowering. Ht 1.5m. 
Deciduous.

Hydrangea macrophylla Bridal BouquetHYDR BRID 6 6

White flowers in summer on a medium growing bush. Mop top. Prune in spring. 
Ht 1.5m. Deciduous.

Hydrangea macrophylla BrilliantHYDR BRI 6 6

Red mop head flowers in summer when lime added. Plant in shade. Prune after 
flowering. Ht 1.5m. Deciduous.

Hydrangea macrophylla FireworksHYDR FIRE 6 6

An  new hybrid with interesting petalled double flowers.  Flower colour varies 
from pale pink to white to blue depending on soil acidity. Deciduous.  Ht. 2m

Hydrangea macrophylla HamburgHYDR HAM 6 6

Large deep rose or purple flowers in summer. Hardy. Keep roots moist. Prune 
after flowering. Ht 1.5m. Deciduous.

Hydrangea macrophylla Mathilda GutgesHYDR MAT 6 6

Large mop heads of deep blue on a compact plant in summer. Ht 1m. 
Deciduous.
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Hydrangea macrophylla NigraHYDR NIG 6 6

Dark black stems and pale flowers make a very contrasting bush. Prune in 
spring. Ht. 1.5m. Deciduous.

Hydrangea paniculata KyushuHYDR PAN 175 175

Dainty, long panicles of creamy white flowers in summer, fading to a dusty pink. 
Later and more erect flower heads than H. p. Grandiflora. Hardy. Ht: 1.5m. 
Deciduous. AGM

Hydrangea paniculata LimelightHYDR PANL 175 175

Large, conical flower heads of creamy lime green flowers in summer. Later and 
more erect than H. p. Grandiflora. Hardy. Ht: 2m. Deciduous. AGM

Hydrangea quercifolia Snow FlakeHYDR QSNO 175 175

Large bold leaves turn red in autumn. Double white flowers in summer. Plant in 
shade. Ht 1m. Deciduous.

Ilex aquifolium AngustifoliaILEX ANG 175 175

Slow growing dark green Holly of neat pyramidal habit. Very hardy. (Male) Ht 
2m. Evergreen.

Ilex crenata Mariesii Tom ThumbILEX TOM 175 175

A dwarf hardy Holly for the rock garden. Female. Ht 50cm. Evergreen.

Ilex x meserveae Blue PrinceILEX MESP 175 175

Slow growing and compact bush with purple stems in winter. Male. Ht. 2m. 
Evergreen.

Jasminum polyanthumJASM POL 175 175

Richly fragrant, the buds are pink and open to pure white flowers. Fast growing. 
Great for sunny fences and archways. Ht 3m. Evergreen.

Laurus nobilisLAUR NOB 175 175

Aromatic foliage used in cooking, pyramidal tree or shrub. Stands trimming. 
Thrives in coastal conditions. Ht 2m. Evergreen.

Lavandula angustifolia Blue MountainLAVA BLU 140 140

Blue flowers during summer. Well drained soil, full sun. Used for hedging, 
potpouri, lavender bags, cut flowers, dried decorations and lavender oil. Ht 
50cm.

Lavandula angustifolia Blue Mountain PinkLAVA APP 140 140

A lovely soft pink scented flowering form. Perfect for a sunny site. Makes a 
great hedge. Ht. 50cm

Lavandula i. Arabian NightLAVA ARA 140 140

Heads of deep lavender flowers all summer and heavy lavender scent. Plant in 
a sunny well drained position. Ht 50cm Evergreen

Lavandula int. Dilly DillyLAVA DIL 140 140

Long flower spikes with lengthy violet flowers.  Similar to L. grosso.  60cm

Lavandula stoechas AvonviewLAVA AVO 140 140

Deep purple flowers in upright heads in summer. Very showy. Likes well 
drained soils and sun. Ht. 1m. Evergreen.

Lavandula stoechas Bandera PurpleLAVA SBA 140 140

Spanish Lavender. Really nice bushy plants that hold their form. Plants get 
literally smothered in long lasting flowers.

Lavandula stoechas PukehouLAVA PUK 140 140

Heads of bluish purple flowers all summer. Plant in a sunny well drained 
position. Ht 1m Evergreen

Lavandula x intermedia AlbaLAVA IALB 140 140

White flowers produced during summer, can be dried. Well drained soil, 
preferable full sun. Ht 70cm. Evergreen.
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Lavandula x intermedia BogongLAVA BOG 140 140

Large heads of deep purple blue flowers in summer. Plant in a sunny position. 
Ht 50cm. Evergreen.

Lavandula x intermedia Grey HedgeLAVA GREH 140 140

Large heads of violet/blue flowers in summer. Foliage Grey. Plant in a sunny 
position. Ht 50cm. Evergreen.

Leptospermum LanigerumLEPT LAN 175 175

Evergreen shrub grows up to 4m.  Large spreading shrub.  Hardy.

Leucothoe f. RainbowLEUC RAI 175 175

Short racemes of white flowers appear along stems in November. Leaves 
variegated cream, yellow and pink. Prefer shade and lime free soil. Ht 75cm. 
Evergreen.

Lithocarpus edulisLITCE 175 175

A small bushy tree or large shrub with glabrous young shots .Leaves leathery 
and taperd at both ends scaly when young. Proving hardy and free-fruiting  
given reasonable shelter.

Myrtus apiculata (syn. Luma apiculata)MYRT API 175 175

Bronze green leaves on compact tall shrub with beautiful bronze trunk. White 
flowers in summer. Ht 3m. Evergreen.

Myrtus KathrynMYRT KAT 175 175

NZ native shrub with oval leaves in deep red. Excellent for flower arranging. Ht 
2m. Evergreen.

Myrtus ugniMYRT UGN 175 175

A slow growing small sized bush with aromatic leaves. Flowers are waxy pink 
bells. Fruits are edible tasty mahogany -red berries. Ht 1m. Evergreen.

Nandina domestica FirepowerNAND FIR 175 175

Bright leaves of gold and orange. Plant in a sunny garden. Ht.1m. Evergreen.

Nyssa sylvatica v. bifloraNYSS SYLB 175 175

Small slender trunked tree suited to confined spaces.  Prefers moist sites.  
Early autumn colour a bright red. Deciduous.Ht 8m

Olearia lineataOLEA LIN 175 175

NZ native plant slender angular branches

Olearia odorataOLEA ODO 175 175

Bushy shrub with many erect reddish twigs bearing pale narrow oval leaves that 
are white underneath inhabiting open areas east of Main Divide. Ht 1.5m

Olearia paniculata Kaikoura CrinkleyOLEA KAI 175 175

Hardy and tolerant of coastal conditions. White flowers in summer. Evergreen. 
Ht. 2m.

Parahebe catarractae BluePARA CATB 175 175

A flat growing native with blue flowers in summer for a moist garden. Evergreen.

Phormium cookianumPHOR COO 175 175

A fine native with attractive green pendant leaves. Hardy. Ht. 1.5m. Evergreen.

Phormium Emerald GreenPHOR EME 175 175

Small green flax. Compact and clump forming native for the front of the border. 
Ht. 75cm

Phormium tenaxPHOR TEN 175 175

A fine native with attractive green pendant leaves. Hardy. Ht. 1m. Evergreen.

Picea abiesPICE ABI 175 175

Tall growing shelter or specimen tree with green needles. Very stately conifer. 
Ht. 5m. Evergreen. The traditional european xmas tree
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Pimelia prostrataPIME PRO 175 175

Flat growing hardy native for the rock garden. White flowers in summer. 
Evergreen.

Pittosporum eugenoidesPITT EUG 175 175

A native with dark twigs and glossy green oblong leaves. Hardy. Ht 4m. 
Evergreen.

Pittosporum t. Tom ThumbPITT TOM 175 175

Bright purple black leaves all year. A compact tidy bush for the garden or tub. 
Ht 100cm. Evergreen. AGM - award of garden merit from the Royal 
Horticultural Society.

Pittosporum ten Lighten UpPITT LUP 6 6

NEW 2020. Delightful, fine, confetti foliaged matapo with gold centred deep 
green leaves. Developed in Central Otago as one of the hardiest pittosporums. 
Forms an amazing narrow hedge. Ht 1.5m

Pittosporum tenuifoliumPITT TEN 175 175

Delightful small tree. Slender shape and pyramidal form. Fragrant flowers. Can 
be trimmed to any desirable size. Ht 3m. Evergreen. Native.

Pittosporum tenuifoliumPITT TEN 6 6

Delightful small tree. Slender shape and pyramidal form. Fragrant flowers. Can 
be trimmed to any desirable size. Ht 3m. Evergreen. Native.

Podocarpus dacrydioides (Dacrycarpus dacrydioides)PODO DAC 175 175

White Pine. A tall native for a damp garden. Hardy if in bush conditions. A fine 
specimen tree. Ht. 5m. Evergreen.

Pseudopanax discolorPSEU DIS 175 175

A compact native for the woodland garden. Protect from frost. Ht.1.5m. 
Evergreen.

Pseudowintera c. Winter FirePSEW WIN 175 175

Leaves turn red in the winter, grey green in summer. Likes shade. Ht. 1m. 
Evergreen native.

Pseudowintera colarata Red LeopardPSEW RED 175 175

Medium sized native shrub with unusual colour and aromatic leaves marked 
red. Grows best in light woodland conditions. Ht 75cm-1m. Evergreen. PVR 
SHM086

Ribes laurifoliumRIBE LAU 175 175

Cream yellow flowers in early May on a upright bushy shrub.  Very hardy.  
Prune after flowering.  Ht 1.5m evergreen

Rosmarinus MozartROSM MOZ 140 140

The deepest blue Rosemary covering itself in flowers in early spring through 
summer.  A great plant for a dry site.  Ht 1m

Rosmarinus officinalis  Majorca PinkROSM MAJ 140 140

A small shrub with soft pink flowers and fragrant leaves. This herb is used in 
cooking and pot pourri. Upright habit. Ht 1m. Evergreen.

Rosmarinus officinalis John McLarenROSM OFF 140 140

Forms a dense shrub that is ideal for a hedge.  Blue flowers in spring.  
Evergreen. Hardy.

Rosmarinus officinalis John McLarenROSM OFF 175 175

Forms a dense shrub that is ideal for a hedge.  Blue flowers in spring.  
Evergreen. Hardy.

Rosmarinus officinalis Tuscan BlueROSM TUS 175 175

A small shrub with bright blue flowers and fragrant leaves. This herb is used in 
cooking and pot pourri. Upright habit. Ht 1m. Evergreen.
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Sarcococca ruscifolia var. chinensisSARC RUSC 175 175

Masses of crimson berries in winter. In late winter, the tiny flowers give off the 
most wonderful fragrance.  Makes excellent tub plant or shrub for shady areas. 
Very hardy. Ht 1m. Evergreen.

Soleirolia soleirolii SilverSOLE 90 090

A silver form of Soleirolia - Babys Tears

Sophora molloyi Early GoldSOPH EAR 175 175

Early yellow flowers on a compact bush.  A most attractive native. Ht. 1m. 
Evergreen.

Sophora tetraptera upright formSOPH TETS 175 175

The largest of the Kowhais, forming a tall column, and then a bold,round 
headed tree.The large flowers are attactive to bellbirds and tuis.

Thuja occidentalis SmaragdTHUJ OCCS 175 175

Formal upright columnar tree green all year. A very fine accent plant. Ht. 2m. 
Evergreen.

Vaccinium delavayiVACC DEL 175 175

Compact small shrub with pale pink bells in summer followed by grape-like fruit. 
Prefers shade and moisture.  Ht 50cm. Evergreen.

Viburnum opulus  XanthocarpumVIBU XAN 175 175

Clear golden yellow fruits in autumn on a compact hardy easily grown bush. 
Prune in winter. Ht.2m. Deciduous.

Viburnum opulus Notcutt's VarietyVIBU NOT 175 175

Large white flower heads on a very hardy bush in late spring/early summer. 
Glistening red fruits form in autumn and last well into the winter.  Ht. 1.5m. 
Deciduous.

Viburnum opulus Sterile syn. V.o. RoseumVIBU STE 175 175

Very hardy shrub with large white ball shaped flowers in spring. Ht 2m. 
Deciduous.

Viburnum plicatumVIBU PLI 175 175

Very hardy spreading shrub with white pompom flowers in spring. Good autumn 
colour. Ht 1.5m. Deciduous.

Viburnum plicatum tomentosum Pink BeautyVIBU PIN 175 175

Blush pink flat flowers in spring on tiered branches. Hardy. Ht. 2m. Deciduous.

Viburnum plicatum tomentosum Summer SnowflakeVIBU SUM 175 175

White flowers produced abundantly in early summer along the upper sides of 
the branches giving a snow covered appearance. Ht 1.5m. Semi evergreen.

Viburnum tinus Eve PriceVIBU TEV 6 6

Compact hardy shrub with carmine buds opening white tinged pink in winter. A 
most attractive shrub for hedges or the garden. Ht. 1.5m. Evergreen.

Viburnum x burkwoodiiVIBU BUR 175 175

Fragrant white flushed pink flowers in early spring. Oval leaves of glossy green 
turning orange in autumn to winter. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen.

Viburnum x burkwoodii FulbrookVIBU FUL 175 175

Pink heads of sweetly scented flowers in spring opening white. Hardy. Ht. 2m. 
Deciduous.

Perennials
Agapanthus ValAGAP VAL 175 175

Dense heads of deep blue flowers in February. Very showy. Ideal cut flower 
and garden decoration. Plant in a sunny garden.Ht 1m Deciduous

Aquilegia fl. Pumila f. AlbaAQUI PUMA 140 140

A dwarf mound with white flowers in spring and summer and grey-green 
foliage. Perfect for the rock garden. Ht 25cm
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Astilbe arendsii ShowstarASTI SHO 140 140

A dwarf perennial with dark green divided leaves which are bronze when young. 
Flowers are red, pink or white in summer.

Brunnera macrophyllaBRUN MAC 175 175

Clumps of green leaves. Blue For Get Me Not like flowers in summer. Ht. 40cm.

Calamintha nepeta Blue CloudCALA NEPB 140 140

Bright light blue flowers on a compact flowering perennial that flowers over a 
long period.  Ht 30cm

Cerastium YoyoCERA YOY 140 140

A more restrained variety. Good for dry areas. White blooms form a snow like 
carpet.

Convallaria majalis RoseaCONV MAR 140 140

Spikes of highly scented pink flowers in late spring, great woodland ground 
cover. Likes a cool shaded garden. Ht. 20cm.

Dianella revoluta RevelationDIAN RRE 175 175

A medium sized flax like plant that grows to about 50cm. It has blue tones to 
the foliage and a green reverse to the leaves.

Echinacea Artisan Red OmbreECHI ARO 140 140

Mass display of gorgeous, vibrant red shades that then mature gracefully.

Echinacea Artisan Yellow OmbreECHI ARTY 140 140

Mass display of gorgeous, vibrant yellow flowers that then mature gracefully.

Echinacea purpurea DoubledeckerECHI DOU 140 140

A large magenta-pink daisies with a second smaller flower produced on top of 
each dark brown central cone. Flowers start in midsummer .  Flowers are very 
attractive to butterflies.

Gaura Emmeline Pink BouquetGAUR EPB 140 140

Gazania Velvet BelleGAZA VEL 175 175

Gypsophila Bristol FairyGYPS FAI 140 140

Highly sought after cut flower.Double white flowers in summer.Plant in a sunny 
position.Ht 1m. Deciduous.

Heuchera Black TaffetaHEUC BLAT 175 175

Silky dark foliage makes this Heuchera more sun tolerant than the rest.Ht 30cm.

Heuchera Lime MarmaladeHEUC LEMM 175 175

Clear lime green leaves, great ground cover for lightly shaded garden

Heuchera micrantha Peach CrispHEUC PEA 175 175

Highly filled peach pink coloured from of the very popular heuchera.  A great 
plant for a shaded area.

Incarvillea delavayii AlbaINCA DELA 140 140

Hardy perennial with white flowers in early summer. Do not let dry out. Ht 25cm. 
Deciduous.

Incarvillea maireiINCA MAI 140 140

Deep pink flowers on a low growing perennial.  Ht 30cm

Iris siberica New HybridsIRIS SIBN 140 140

A wide range colors from form blue to cream. A durable, low maintenance 
species.  Ht 80cm

Kniphofia  Ex  L ThompsonKNIP EXLT 175 175

Yellow flowers on a compact form.

Kniphofia uvaria CreamKNIP BOR 175 175

Lemon to white flower spikes attractive to nectar loving birds.Summer to 
Autumn flowering. Ht 70cm.
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Lathyrus vernus RainbowLATH RAI 175 175

A clump forming perennial with pea like flowers of either pink , white or purple.  
Prefers a cooler summer site so plant in part shade of a hot area. Ht 25cm.

Limonium gmelini ssp hungaricumLIMO HUN 140 140

50cm plant with bright lilac-blue flowers

Lobelia siphilitica AlbaLOBE SYPA 140 140

White flowers in long spikes in autumn. Plant in well drained soil in sun. Ht 
50cm.

Lobelia starship BlueLOBE SBL 140 140

Deep, violet-blue flowers are produced on incredibly upright flower spikes.

Lobelia starship BurgundyLOBE SBUR 140 140

Showy, mid-height plants covered with masses of flowers.

Polemonium yezoense Purple RainPOLE YPR 140 140

50cm plant, large  violet  flowers dark stems with leaves turning reddish purple 
in winter reblooms after dead heading

Potentilla argyrophylla Golden StarlitPOTE AGO 140 140

30cm plant with pure bright golden blossoms, very compact dense habit.

Primula denticulata Rubin selectionPRIM DRU 140 140

Pink-red globular flowers in spring on a flat rosette of leaves. One of the first 
flowers to come out.

Primula flaccidaPRIM FLA 140 140

Powders blue flowers on stems about 15cm long with wonderful scent.

Primula jap. AppleblossomPRIM JAPAP 140 140

Bright light pink flowers in spring. Plant in a shaded moist garden. Hardy. Ht. 
50cm.

Primula jap. Millers CrimsonPRIM JAPM 140 140

Red/Crimson flowers in spring. Plant in a shaded moist garden. Hardy. Ht. 
50cm.

Primula japonica AlbaPRIM JAPA 140 140

Bright white flowers in spring. Plant in a shaded moist garden. Hardy. Ht. 50cm.

Primula vulgarisPRIM VUL 140 140

Heads of dusky lemon in spring. Plant in a shaded damp but well drained 
garden. HT. 20cm.

Primula x pubescens Exhibition RotPRIM PUBE 140 140

Early Spring Flowering. Full sun in cool summer climates to semi-shade.  A 
new Auricula-Strain.  Ht 25cm

Primula x pubescens KaleidoscopePRIM PUBK 140 140

Bright mix of colours including yellow red blue and cream white.  Large flowers 
form in late winter and continue to flower through spring.  Ht 20cm

Pulsatilla vulgaris AlbaPULS VULA 140 140

Creamy white flowers in spring followed by fluffy seed heads in summer. Plant 
in moist soil.

Pulsatilla vulgaris Red BellsPULS REBS 140 140

Bright red flowers on a compact perennial in summer. Best grown in a sunny 
site.

Rodgersia HenriciRODG HEN 140 140

Pink to red flower steams with dark green foliage that has a hint of bronze. Best 
grown in a moist part shaded garden Ht 90cm

Stokesia laevisSTOK LAE 140 140

Easily grown in well-drained soils in full sun. Tolerates filtered sunlight, but 
prefers full sun. Prefers moist soils, but is drought tolerant. Flowers are lilac 
blue and flower over summer.  Ht 30cm
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Stokesia laevisSTOK LAE 150 150

Easily grown in well-drained soils in full sun. Tolerates filtered sunlight, but 
prefers full sun. Prefers moist soils, but is drought tolerant. Flowers are lilac 
blue and flower over summer.  Ht 30cm

Stokesia laevis AlbaSTOK LAEA 140 140

Easily grown in well-drained soils in full sun. Tolerates filtered sunlight, but 
prefers full sun. Prefers moist soils, but is drought tolerant. Flowers are White 
and flower over summer.  Ht 30cm

Trollius eur. Lemon SupremeTROL LEM 140 140

Lemon yellow flowers on a compact perennial during summer. Ht 30cm

Rhodos
Azalea Dorothy CorstonAZAL DOR OG OG

Deep orange red flowers on a compact bush in Nov.  Ht. 1m. 
Deciduous.(Knaphill)

Azalea Pavlova1 AZAL PAV 250 250

Scented double white flowers on a strong upright bush in November. Hardy. 
Raised by Denis here at Blue Mountain Nurseries. Mildew resistant.  Ht.1.5m. 
Deciduous.

Azalea PavlovaAZAL PAV OG OG

Scented double white flowers on a strong upright bush in November. Hardy. 
Raised by Denis here at Blue Mountain Nurseries. Mildew resistant.  Ht.1.5m. 
Deciduous.

Azalea Pink Chiffon1 AZAL PINC 250 250

Double pink flowers in Nov. On a compact bush. Plant needs shelter from wind. 
Scented. Ht. 1.5m. Deciduous. (Blue Mountain)

Azalea Pink ChiffonAZAL PINC 250 250

Double pink flowers in Nov. On a compact bush. Plant needs shelter from wind. 
Scented. Ht. 1.5m. Deciduous. (Blue Mountain)

Azalea SaharaAZAL SAH 250 250

Bushy Knaphill Azalea with golden yellow flowers in late Nov. Deciduous. Ht 
1.5m

Azalea SaharaAZAL SAH ST ST

Bushy Knaphill Azalea with golden yellow flowers in late Nov. Deciduous. Ht 
1.5m

Rhodo Albert Schweitzer1 RHOD ALBS 25 250

A large shrub of upright habit with large conical trusses of rose-Bengal flowers 
with a deeper red blotch in Nov. Ht 1.5m

Rhodo Alison JohnstoneRHOD ALJ OG OG

Flowers amber with pink frosting in Oct on an upright bush. NO LIME. Likes 
cool roots. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Anka Heinje1 RHOD ANK 250 250

Splendid red buds open to rosy pink flowers which are sprinkled with golden 
markings. Beige indumentum coats the undersides of the leaves. Ht 1m.

Rhodo Backer's Gold1 RHOD BAC 250 250

Pink shading yellow flowers in Oct. NO LIME. Evergreen.

Rhodo Beau Brummel1 RHOD BEA 250 250

Dark red flowers on a compact bush in Nov. NO LIME. Ht 1.25cm. Evergreen.

Rhodo Beautiful Day1 RHOD BEAD 25 250

Large yellow flowers with orange strips in throat in Nov. Likes shade. NO LIME. 
Ht 1.5m.
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Rhodo Belkanto1 RHOD BELK 25 250

Flowers pale yellow, funnel shape, tinged pale yellowish pink; dorsal spotting 
greenish yellow on bright chartreuse base. Compact bush. Ht 1.4m.

Rhodo BelkantoRHOD BELK OG OG

Flowers pale yellow, funnel shape, tinged pale yellowish pink; dorsal spotting 
greenish yellow on bright chartreuse base. Compact bush. Ht 1.4m.

Rhodo BerniceRHOD BERI OG OG

Frost tender Rhododendron (R. maddenii x maddenii, R. Royal Flush) Trusses 
hold 7 flowers, 5
lobed, crimson becoming bush white on margins. Ht 1.5m. Sep flowering.

Rhodo Bernstein1 RHOD BERN 25 250

Amber yellow-orange flowers in Nov. Compact bush. NO LIME. Shelter from 
wind. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Betsie BalcomRHOD BETB OG OG

Flowers currant red in large truss in Oct. Compact plant. NO LIME. Ht 1.5m. 
Evergreen.

Rhodo Blue Mist1 RHOD BLUM 25 250

Tall, upright plant. Pale lavender blue flowers tinted red purple. 1.5m

Rhodo BremenRHOD BRE OG OG

Dwarf plant with early pink flowers in loose truss in Sept. Ht. 50cm. Evergreen.

Rhodo BrigitteRHOD BRIG OG OG

Compact truss of rose purple, maturing to white flowers in Nov. Forms a neat 
compact bush. Ht 1.25m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Brown Eyes1 RHOD BROW 2 250

Full trusses of rose-pink flowers with brown spotting are produced on this free-
flowering vigorous plant with deep green foliage in Oct. Ht 2m.

Rhodo Brown EyesRHOD BROW OG OG

Full trusses of rose-pink flowers with brown spotting are produced on this free-
flowering vigorous plant with deep green foliage in Oct. Ht 2m.

Rhodo Bumble Bee1 RHOD BUM P6 P6

A medium upright grower of dark glossy green foliage and large trusses of 
purple blooms. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen. Flowers Nov.

Rhodo Burnaby CentennialRHOD BURC OG OG

Large raspberry pink flowers in perfect trusses with black anthers creating a 
magnificent display in late Oct. Leaves dark green. Ht 1.5m.

Rhodo Burnaby Centennial SportRHOD BURS OG 250

Rhodo Burnished Brass1 RHOD BURN 25 250

Large, strong vigorous growing plant with thick leathery forest green leaves. 
Freely produced bright red frilly flowers in large ball trusses. Ht 2m

Rhodo Cary Ann1 RHOD CARA 25 250

Flowers coral pink, trumpet shaped on large conical trusses in Oct. Attractive 
dark green foliage. Ht 1m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Cary AnnRHOD CARA OG OG

Flowers coral pink, trumpet shaped on large conical trusses in Oct. Attractive 
dark green foliage. Ht 1m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Cheer1 RHOD CHE 250 250

Pink trusses in Sept on a compact hardy bush. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Cinnkeys1 RHOD CIN OG OG

Unusual tubular bicolour flowers of red - yellow. The plant lends itself to being 
espaliered on a wall. Ht. 1.5m. Evergreen.
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Rhodo CinnkeysRHOD CIN OG OG

Unusual tubular bicolour flowers of red - yellow. The plant lends itself to being 
espaliered on a wall. Ht. 1.5m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Cornubia1 RHOD COR 250 250

Bright red flowers in Sept. Upright grower. Ht 2.5m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Cunningham's WhiteRHOD CUN OG OG

Buds of flush pink open to masses of smaller flowers of white with a pale yellow 
centre. Late Oct flowering. Evergreen. Ht 2m

Rhodo Diane Titcomb1 RHOD DIAN 25 250

A shrub of large foliage and fine trusses of white flowers with pink edging in 
Oct. Ht 2m. Evergreen.

Rhodo dichroanthum1 RHOD DIC OG OG

Light orange flowers with a large caylax in late Oct. NO LIME. Ht. 1m. 
Evergreen.

Rhodo dichroanthumRHOD DIC OG OG

Light orange flowers with a large caylax in late Oct. NO LIME. Ht. 1m. 
Evergreen.

Rhodo Dora Amateis1 RHOD DORA 2 250

Pure white flowers cling to this low growing bushy plant. Will stand full sun. 
Flowers Oct. Ht 1m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Dora AmateisRHOD DORA OG OG

Pure white flowers cling to this low growing bushy plant. Will stand full sun. 
Flowers Oct. Ht 1m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Dr Blok1 RHOD DRB 250 250

Large pink. flowers with paler centre and yellow fair.largergrower. 1.5m

Rhodo Earl of Athlone1 RHOD EAR 250 250

One of the finest red trusses, dome-shaped, compact. Flowers of bright blood 
red in Nov. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Ebony Pearl1 RHOD EBO 250 250

Pink flower broadly funnel-shaped, opens soft mauve-pink, fading to white at 
edges with a ray of reddish-brown spots. Conical-shaped truss.

Rhodo Ed HillaryRHOD EDH OG OG

grande x williamsianum seedling. Medium size 1.5 Meters. Soft pink flowers in 
October

Rhodo Edith Boulter1 RHOD EDI 250 250

Frilled lavender pink flowers with deeper margins. Compact round trusses in 
early-mid season. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Emanuela1 RHOD EMA 250 250

Flowers bright pink inside the flower pure white in Oct ,foliage dark green. 
Compact Ht 1 m

Rhodo Felicitas1 RHOD FEL 250 250

A compact rounded bushy plant with dark green leaves.  The flowers are pink 
and yellow flowering late season in Nov.  Ht 1.5m

Rhodo FragrantissimaRHOD FRA OG OG

Sweetly scented white flowers in spring. Shelter from frost. Can be an open 
bush. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen

Rhodo Freeman R Stevenson1 RHOD FREE 25 250

Cherry red spots on a tall pink truss in early Oct. NO LIME. Ht. 2m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Furnivall's Daughter1 RHOD FUR 250 250

Pink flowers in Oct with a cherry red blotch.  Ht 1.5m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Gartendirektor GlockerRHOD GARG OG OG

Flowers deep rose pink in Oct. NO LIME. Shelter from wind. Ht. .9m. Evergreen.
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Rhodo Gartendirektor Reiger1 RHOD GARR 2 250

Flowers cream with a red spot in Oct. Ht 1m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Gartendirektor ReigerRHOD GARR OG OG

Flowers cream with a red spot in Oct. Ht 1m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Genghis Khan1 RHOD GEN 250 250

Flowers guardsman red with enlarge calix of the same colour. Ht 1.5m. 
Evergreen.

Rhodo Germania1 RHOD GERM 2 250

Vigorous compact plant twice as wide as high. Buds deep pink. Flattened rose 
pink corolla, pale in the centre. Large matte green leaves.  Ht 1.2m

Rhodo Goblin Pink1 RHOD GOBP 2 250

Soft rose pink flowers in Oct. NO LIME. Shelter from wind. Ht. 1m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Gomer Waterer1 RHOD GOM 25 250

Rose pink buds opening almost white in late Nov. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen

Rhodo Graham Holmes1 RHOD GRAH 2 250

Bright rosy pink flowers in October with a dark spot in the throat. A compact 
bush to 2m.

Rhodo Graham's Joy1 RHOD GRAJ 25 250

Beautifully compact grower mid season flowering (late Oct) with blush pink 
flowers. Ht 1.5m

Rhodo Gretsel1 RHOD GRET 25 250

Large flowers of salmon orange to shell pink on a compact plant in October. Ht 
1.25m. Evergreen.

Rhodo GretselRHOD GRET OG OG

Large flowers of salmon orange to shell pink on a compact plant in October. Ht 
1.25m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Gwyneth MastersRHOD GWEM OG OG

Large waxy red flowers in Nov. Leaves are dark green on a bushy plants.  NO 
LIME. A new hybrid from Taranaki raised and registered by Mrs G. Masters. Ht 
1.5m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Happy Anniversary1 RHOD HAP 250 250

Flowers are soft pink fading to almost white in Nov on a compact rounded 
bush. Ht 1m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Hawaiian Sunset1 RHOD HAW 25 250

Large high truss of wide funnel shaped frilly flowers of sunset orange in mid 
season. Ht 1.25-1.5m

Rhodo Helen Deehr1 RHOD HELD 25 250

Crimson bell shaped flowers in a ball truss in October. New foliage has tan 
indumentum. Ht. 1m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Helene Schiffner1 RHOD HELE 25 250

Dark buds open to white flowers, tinged lilac with a faint yellow marking in the 
throat, held in a tight ball truss in October. One of the best small neat bushy 
whites. Ht. 1m.AGM

Rhodo Hydon Hunter1 RHOD HYD 250 250

Flowers light pink to white on compact plant in Nov.  Ht 1m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Hydon HunterRHOD HYD 250 250

Flowers light pink to white on compact plant in Nov.  Ht 1m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Impi1 RHOD IMPI 250 250

Very late (November) dark red flowers on a compact bush. NO LIME. HT. 1m. 
Evergreen.
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Rhodo J.P. Lade1 RHOD JPL OG OG

Soft lavender blue flowers in mid season. A hardy bushy plant. Ht 1.5m. 
Evergreen.

Rhodo Jodie King1 RHOD JOD 250 250

Deep pink flowers softening with age, in Oct. Ht 1.m

Rhodo Jodie KingRHOD JOD 250 250

Deep pink flowers softening with age, in Oct. Ht 1.m

Rhodo Lavender Girl1 RHOD LAV 250 250

Flowers of pale lavender edged with rosy mauve, paler in centre with golden 
brown spotting. Flowers in Oct. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Leda1 RHOD LED 250 250

Compact grower with orange red flowers in Oct. Ht. 1m. Evergreen. NO LIME.

Rhodo Lem's Stormcloud1 RHOD LEMS 25 250

Red flowers paler in the centre to near white in Nov. Likes some shade. Ht 
1.5m Evergreen.

Rhodo Lem's StormcloudRHOD LEMS 250 250

Red flowers paler in the centre to near white in Nov. Likes some shade. Ht 
1.5m Evergreen.

Rhodo maddenii pink1 RHOD MADP 25 250

Pink flowers in Nov.Shelter from wind and frost.Ht. 1.5m

Rhodo maddenii pinkRHOD MADP OG OG

Pink flowers in Nov.Shelter from wind and frost.Ht. 1.5m

Rhodo Maureen1 RHOD MAUR 2 OG

Seedling from Peter Haughy's garden in Heriot. Medium size with peachy, 
orange flowers.

Rhodo MaureenRHOD MAUR OG OG

Seedling from Peter Haughy's garden in Heriot. Medium size with peachy, 
orange flowers.

Rhodo Melody1 RHOD MEL 250 250

Pink and white flowers in late Oct on a compact bush to 1.2m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Mindys Love1 RHOD MIND 25 OG

Medium compact grower. Apricot buds opening  greenish/ yellow maturing to 
creamy/yellow flowers with red markings.

Rhodo Mindys LoveRHOD MIND OG OG

Medium compact grower. Apricot buds opening  greenish/ yellow maturing to 
creamy/yellow flowers with red markings.

Rhodo Mission Bells1 RHOD MIS 250 250

Pale pink flowers in Oct. Compact bush. NO LIME. Ht 1m. Evergreen. Limited 
Stock!

Rhodo Molly Miller1 RHOD MOLM 2 250

Flowers yellow with a tinge of rose. Foliage with some indumentum beneath. 
Mid season flowering. Ht 1m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Morgenrot (Morning Red)1 RHOD MORG 2 250

Bright red flowers in Oct.  Shelter from wind. Ht. 1m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Morning Cloud1 RHOD MOR 250 250

Pink flowers flushed pale lavender pink fading to cream in Nov. Ht 1m. 
Evergreen.

Rhodo Morning CloudRHOD MOR 250 250

Pink flowers flushed pale lavender pink fading to cream in Nov. Ht 1m. 
Evergreen.
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Rhodo Mrs Betty Robertson1 RHOD MRSB 25 250

Creamy yellow flowers with a red blotch in Oct. NO LIME. Compact. Ht 1.5m. 
Evergreen.

Rhodo Mrs Charles Pearson1 RHOD MRSP O OG

Vigorous plant. Flowers a soft pink in good trusses in mid season. Ht 2m. 
Evergreen.

Rhodo Mrs Mary Ashley1 RHOD MRSM 2 250

Salmon pink shaded cream flowers on a neat bushy plant in Oct. NO LIME. Ht 
1.25m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Nicholas1 RHOD NIC OG ST

Deep purple flowers in Nov. Pale eye in the middle of the flower. Medium to tall 
grower. 1.5 Meters

Rhodo One Thousand Butterflies1 RHOD ONE 250 250

Flowers pink to pale pink in Nov. Ht. 1.5m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Pania1 RHOD PANI 25 250

Lovley pale pink open bell shaped flowers with a yellow cream center. 
Flowering mid October. 1.5 m

Rhodo Pukeiti AnniversaryRHOD PUK 250 250

A tidy compact plant with light green leaves. Buds pinkish opening to a  light 
yellow with a deep red throat in Nov. Ht.1.5m.  A new Rhododendron named for 
the 50th Jubilee of Pukeiti.

Rhodo Ron Arnold1 RHOD RON 250 250

Beautiful light sented white flower edges turning pink tender Rhododendron.

Rhodo Ron ArnoldRHOD RON OG OG

Beautiful light sented white flower edges turning pink tender Rhododendron.

Rhodo Ruby Bowman1 RHOD RUBY 25 250

Long lasting large trusses of rose pink shaded a deeper pink flowering mid 
season. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Ruby BowmanRHOD RUBY OG OG

Long lasting large trusses of rose pink shaded a deeper pink flowering mid 
season. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen.

Rhodo SammetglutRHOD SAM OG OG

Bright red flowers in late Oct, on a tall bush. Ht.2m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Scarlet King Kaka1 RHOD SKK 250 250

Hardy. sun tolerant bushes with red flowers in Oct. NO LIME. Ht. 2m. 
Evergreen.

Rhodo Scarlet King KakaRHOD SKK OG OG

Hardy. sun tolerant bushes with red flowers in Oct. NO LIME. Ht. 2m. 
Evergreen.

Rhodo Sea-tacRHOD SEAT OG OG

Cardinal red flowers in a ball truss. Early Sept flowering. Ht. 1. Evergreen.

Rhodo Simona1 RHOD SIM OG OG

Frilly light pink flowers with spotting on the upper lobe. Flowers Oct. Ht 1.5m.

Rhodo Sir Robert Peel1 RHOD SIRP OG OG

Early flowers cerise pink, tall growing hardy Heritage Rhodo.

Rhodo Spotlight1 RHOD SPO 250 250

Pale pink flowers in late Oct on a compact bush. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen.

Rhodo SpotlightRHOD SPO OG OG

Pale pink flowers in late Oct on a compact bush. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Stadt Essen1 RHOD STA 250 250

Clear pink flowers in Oct. NO LIME. Shelter from wind. Ht 1.2m. Evergreen.
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Rhodo Tiffany1 RHOD TIF 250 250

Small alpine rhodo with Pink flowers and apricot / yellow throat  Ht.1m

Rhodo Trewithan OrangeRHOD TRE OG OG

Orange bell shaped flowers in late Oct, on an upright bush. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen.

Rhodo Wesley HayesRHOD WES OG OG

Aborium Hybrid. Ball truss  of glowing red flowers, pointy leaves. Medium to tall 
grower 2 m. Mid season November flowering.

Small Plants
Cornus alba SibiricaCORN ALB OLVE OLV

Very hardy, bushy shrub with bright red stems in winter, and deep burgundy red 
autumn colour. Ht 2m. Deciduous. AGM

Hydrangea macrophylla AyeshaHYDR AYE 140 140

Bold leaves with flattened dense heads of pale pink scented flowers in summer. 
Ht. 1.5m. Deciduous.

Lavandula stoechas Bandera PinkLAVA SBAP 140 140

Flowers have beautiful soft pink flags sitting on deep-rose flowers.

Small Trees
Acer cappadocicum AureumACER CAU 6 6

Pale gold leaves in summer turning rich butter yellow in autumn. Shelter from 
wind. Ht 2m. Deciduous.

Acer cappadocicum ssp. SinicumACER CAPS 6 6

A tree with a dense rounded crown and long pointed leaves.  Leaves trun 
yellow orange and red in autumn.  Drought tolerant.  Ht 5m

Acer r. Red SunsetACER RUBR 6 6

An upright form of rubrum with good autumn colour. Likes well drained soils. 
Ht.5m.

Acer rubrum ColumnareACER RUBC 9 9

An upright form on rubrum with good autumn colour. Likes well drained soils. 
Ht.5m.

Acer x freemanii Jeffers RedACER FREJ 6 6

A fast growing tree with green leaves turning red in autumn. Hardy. Ht. 4m. 
Deciduous.

Alnus cordataALNU COR 6 6

Fresh green foliage in summer with yellow autumn colour. Fast growing. Hardy. 
Will stand wet. Ht. 4m. Deciduous.

Alnus rubraALNU RUB 6 6

Red stems in winter. Green leaves in summer turning yellow in autumn. Hardy. 
Will stand wet. Ht. 3m. Deciduous.

Apple Gimmer GoldMALU GIM 6 6

Heratage Apple Tree.

Apple LoboMALU LOB 6 6

Large red eating Apple. Also good for cooking and juicing. Mid season.

Azara microphylla VariegataAZAR VAR 6 6

Upright tree of green and cream foliage with scented flowers in summer. Ht 3m. 
Evergreen.

Betula albosinensis var SeptentrionalisBETU ALBOS 6 175

Attractive cinnamon coloured bark. Rich yellow autumn colours. Ht. 10m. 
Deciduous.
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Betula ermanii Grayswood HillBETU ERMG 6 6

(syn. Costata)  A medium to large tree with beautiful white peeling bark and rich 
yellow autumn colour.  Hardy and easily grown.  One of my favourite Birches. 
Ht 5m.  Deciduous.

Betula ermanii Greyswood Hill (syn.costata)BETU COS 6 6

A medium to large tree with beautiful white peeling bark and rich yellow autumn 
colour. Hardy and easily grown. Ht. 5m. Deciduous.

Betula ermanii PolarBETU POL 6 6

Pearly white trunks form a slender upright tree. Butter yellow autumn colours. A 
recent selection from John McLaren.  Ht. 5m. Deciduous.

Betula ermanii PolarBETU POL 9 9

Pearly white trunks form a slender upright tree. Butter yellow autumn colours. A 
recent selection from John McLaren.  Ht. 5m. Deciduous.

Betula papyrifera SubcordataBETU PAPS 6 6

Betula pendula Black PrinceBETU BLA 9 9

Purple leaves brighter when young in summer. Hardy. Orange/yellow autumn 
colour. Ht 4m. Deciduous

Betula pendula LacineataBETU LAC 6 6

Cut Leaf Birch. Attractive all year round.Tall slim yellow autumn colour. Ht 4m. 
Deciduous

Betula pendula Wades GoldenBETU WAD 6 6

A small growing Birch with golden yellow stems making a special display in 
winter when the bare branches look at their best. Great golden autumn colour. 
Ht.3m. Deciduous.

Betula utilis jacquemontiiBETU JAC 6 6

Beautiful white peeling bark and yellow autumn colour. One of the best for white 
trunks and at last being recognised. Hardy and easily grown. Ht. 5m. Deciduous

Betula utilis var. Jacquemontii 'Dazzler'BETU DAZZ 9 9

A fast growing, upright, decidious tree with beautiful snow-white bark with 
glossy, deep-green leaves that become yellow in autumn.

Black Currant GaliathBLAC GAL 9 9L

Old variety dates back to 1847 medium sized bush very erect and well spaced 
branches with short trusses of large sweet berries .

Buddleja alternifoliaBUDD ALT 6 6

A large shrub with graceful arching branches bearing long narrow dark green 
leaves. Delicately fragrant lilac flowers in summer. Ht 2.5m. Deciduous.

Buxus sempervirens Silver BeautyBUXU SIL 6 6

Lush fine green leaves edged silvery white.

Cedrus deodaraCEDR DEO 6 6

The graceful slightly pendulous growth makes a fine well furnished pyramidal 
ornamental conifer. Ht 5m. Evergreen.

Choisya Aztec PearlCHOI AZT 6 6

Pink buds open white with narrow leaves on a compact bush of green. Ht 1.5m. 
Evergreen.

Cornus GreenvaleCORN GRE 6 6

A vigorous tree with large creamy white flowers in early summer. In our trials of 
hardy dogwoods this tree has out performed all others. Raised in Greenvale by 
Mrs L Paterson. New 2004. Evergreen with some autumn colour as well. PVR

Corylus avellanaCORY AVE 6 6

Attractive green leaves in summer. Hazelnuts in late autumn.
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Dacrydium cupressinumDACR CUP 6 6

Rimu. Large native conifer for a sheltered garden. Likes woodland conditions. 
Ht. 4m. Evergreen.

Deutzia pulchraDEUT PUL 6 6

Hardy shrub. In late spring drooping racemes of white lily of the valley like 
flowers. Ht. 2m.

Eucryphia lucida Gilt EdgeEUCR LGI 6 6

A small upright tree with lovely white flowers in summer. Foliage edged gold. 
Ht. 2m. Evergreen.

Fraxinus excelsiorFRAX EXC 6 6

Magnificent round headed tree. Ht. 15m. Deciduous.

Fraxinus ornusFRAX ORN 6 6

A pretty medium sized tree with abundant flowers in spring. Ht 6m. Deciduous.

Ginkgo bilobaGINK BIL 6 6

Upright, rounded form with spectacular deep green leaves, pendant 
appearance. Shelter from wind. Ht. 4m. Grafted female.

Griselinia littoralisGRIS LIT 6 6

Shiny attractive foliage. Very hardy. Ht 2.5m. Evergreen. Native.

Hamamelis x intermediaHAMA INT 6 6

A bushy deciduous shrub growing to 2 m tall and wide, with zig-zagging stems 
with green leaves that turn yellow in autumn. The yellow, orange or red flowers 
with twisted petals appear on bare stems in midwinter through early spring.  Ht 
2m

Koelreuteria paniculataKOEL PAN 9 9

Long cut leaves in summer and brilliant yellow autumn colour. Yellow flowers in 
summer. Ht. 3m. Deciduous.

Laburnum anagyroidesLABU ANA 6 6

Bright yellow racemes in spring make an outstanding small tree. Hardy. HT 3m. 
Deciduous.

Leptospermum LanigerumLEPT LAN 6 6

Evergreen shrub grows up to 4m.  Large spreading shrub.  Hardy.

Leucothoe fontanesiana RollissoniiLEUC ROLL 6 6

A small to medium sized shrub of elegant habit .good ground cover plant with 
narrow green leaves which turn bronze/ red in winter and racemes of white 
flowers.

Leucothoe fontanesiana ScarlettaLEUC KEI 6 6

Small bush with red tinged tips and white flowers in summer. Likes shade. 
Evergreen. Ht. 1m.

Liquidamber styracifluaLIQU STY 6 6

A beautiful large tree with shining green leaves which turn magnificent crimson 
colours in autumn. Ht 5m. Deciduous.

Maackia amurensisMAAC AMU 6 6

A small tree with white flowers in erect racemes in summer. Hardy. Ht. 3m. 
Deciduous.

Magnolia stellataMAGN STE 6 6

One of the smallest growing and hardiest forms of Magnolia. A compact 
rounded shrub with pure white star-like fragrant flowers profusely borne. Ht 
2.5m. Deciduous.

Malus sargentiiMALU SAR 6 6

A little known small tree grown for masses of white flowers in spring. These are 
followed in autumn by cherry like fruits in yellow or red. Ht. 3m. Deciduous
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Metrosideros robusta Tanes GoldMETR TANG 6 6

lovely variegated form with cream leaves, edged green

Michelia GracipiesMICH GRA 9 9

Small rounded matt green leaves on a compact bush, profusion of small white, 
highly fragrant flowers. Hardy. Free draining soil.  Warm sunny/semi-shaded 
place. Ht 2m

Myrtus apiculata (syn. Luma apiculata)MYRT API 6 6

Bronze green leaves on compact tall shrub with beautiful bronze trunk. White 
flowers in summer. Ht 3m. Evergreen.

Nyssa sylvaticaNYSS SYL 8.5 8.5

Excellent autumn colours make this a great tree for the small garden. Ht 3m. 
Deciduous.

Phebalium phylicifoliaPHEB PHY 6 6

Bright yellow flowers on a small bush in late spring to summer. Easy to grow in 
a well drained warm garden. Ht. 1.5m. E.

Photinia beauverdianaPHOT BEAU 6 6

Small tree up to 2m high conspicuous in summer with Hawthorn-like flowers 
and in Autumn bedecked with dark red fruit and richly tinted leaves

Platanus orientalisPLAT ORI 6 6

A large stately tree with wide spreading branches. Attractive deep lobed leaves. 
Ht. 5m. Deciduous

Populus yunnanensisPOPU YUN 9 9

Broadly columnar is habit.  New growth is a lovely red turing to dark green as it 
matures.  Scented when coming into leaf.  Decidious Ht 5m

Prunus Sub. Lorraine's Early BirdPRUN LOB 6 6

Small dainty tree, white blushed pink blossoms through winter and early 
spring.Good orange red autumn colour,  3m at maturity. Selected seedling from 
Mrs Patterson of Greenvale.

Prunus yed. CraigLea RosePRUN YEDCR 6 6

Masses of showy single rose pink blooms paling to shell pink on the tips. 
Attractive bark. Vigorous and upright. Ht. 6m.

Pseudopanax arborea Ross GoldPSEU ARBG 9 9

Large glossy gold/green leaves divided into 5 to 7 leaflets. Native for shady 
position. Ht 3m. Evergreen.

Quercus cocciniaQUER COC 9 9

A large tree with glistening green leaves in summer turning magnificent red in 
autumn. One of the finest trees for autumn colour. Ht 5m. Deciduous.

Quercus ellipsoidalisQUER ELL 9 9

A medium tree with a short trunk and wide spreading head. Deeply lobed 
leaves turn crimson in autumn. Ht. 5m. Deciduous.

Quercus roburQUER ROB 9 9

A large long lived tree developing a broad head with rugged branches. Ht 6m. 
Deciduous.

Quercus rubraQUER RUB 9 9

A large tree with glistening green leaves in summer turning magnificent red in 
autumn. One of the finest trees for autumn colour. Ht 5m. Deciduous.

Rubus tridel BenendenRUBU BEN 6 6

White flowers in summer. Very hardy bushy shrub. Ht. 1.5m. Deciduous.

Salix matsudana PendulaSALI MPEN 6 9L

A disease free form of the Pekin willow.Beautiful weeping habit, quick 
growing,hardy and wind tolerant.doesn't mind wet conditions. Can be heavily 
pruned. Deciduous. Ht 6m
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Salix repens ArgenteaSALI ARG 6 6

Attractive weeping shrub with silvery leaves. Very hardy. Deciduous. AGM

Salix tortuosaSALI TOR 6 6

Corkscrew Willow.  Very fast growing.  Spirally contorted twigs and branches.  
A most useful willow for sunny sites and moist soils with outstanding 
ornamental value throughout the year.

Salix x sepulcralis ChrysocomaSALI VITPA 6 6

Wide spreading tree with yellow weeping branches. Very hardy. Will stand wet. 
Ht. 5m. AGM. Syn S. vitellina Pendula Aurea.

Skimmia japonica RogersiiSKIM JFE 6 6

Compact female clone with clusters of red berries throughout the winter months 
with scented white flowers in spring. Likes shade. Ht 1m. Evergreen.

Sorbus americanaSORB AME 6 6

Small bright red fruits in autumn. Beautiful red auautmn colour. Hardy. Ht. 3m. 
Deciduous.

Sorbus ariaSORB ARI 9 9

Compact tree with white under leaves turning gold russet in autumn with 
crimson berries. Takes wind. Ht 6m. Deciduous.

Sorbus aronioidesSORB ARO 9 9

Red fruits on a broadly coumnar tree with large green leaves.  Ht 5m

Sorbus cashmerianaSORB CAS 6 6

Gleaming white, marble-like fruits in hanging clusters, may last well into winter. 
Often a multi stemmed tree. Ht 3m. Deciduous

Sorbus domesticaSORB DOM 6 6

Clusters of white flowers in spring on a broadly columnar tree. Very sour fruit 
has been used to make a beer. Ht. 10m. Deciduous.

Sorbus hupehensis [ syn pseudohupehensis ]SORB HUP 6 6

A neat small tree with large bunches of pink and white berries in autumn the 
blue /green leaves of summer turn a  spectacular deep red. Ht.5m. 
Deciduous.   AGM.

Sorbus hupehensis ApertaSORB HUPA 6 6

Sorbus koehneanaSORB KOE 8 6

Upright growing hardy shrub with white flowers in summer and white fruits in 
autumn. Ht. 3m. Deciduous.

Sorbus wilsonianaSORB WIL 6 6

An upright small tree with good autumn colour.  The large clusters of orange 
berries make a great display in autumn and winter.  Ht. 3m

Tilia americanaTILI AME 6 6

Large toothed green leaves in summer turning yellow in autumn. Ht. 5m. 
Deciduous.

Tilia cordataTILI COR 6 6

Leathery, dark green leaves, pale green beneath turning yellow in autumn. Tiny 
scented white flowers in summer. Ht. 4m. Deciduous.

Tilia platyphyllosTILI PLA 6 6

Vigorous growing round headed tree. Handsome specimen tree. Hardy. Ht.5m. 
Deciduous.

Tilia x europaeaTILI EUR 6 6

A long lived tree with rounded leaves, green in summer, yellow in autumn. 
Hardy. Ht. 4m. Deciduous.

Weigela Dark HorseWEIG DAH 6 6

Lovely dark, vigorous form with bright pink flowers.  Ht 1m
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Smaller Plants
Acer cappadocicum AureumACER CAU OLV OLV

Pale gold leaves in summer turning rich butter yellow in autumn. Shelter from 
wind. Ht 2m. Deciduous.

Acer rubrum BowhallACER RUBB OLV OLV

Broadly columnar tree with spectacular colours of red. orange and yellow in 
Autumn.Deciduous 5m

Acer rubrum BrandywineACER RUBW OL OLV

Neat upright bright green shade tree.  In autumn the leaves turn brilliant red and 
burgundy making this one of the best early autumn displays.  Ht.5m.

Acer rubrum October GloryACER RUBO OLV OLV

Dark green leaves in autumn turning brilliant red. Hardy. Ht 5m Deciduous

Acer x freemanii ArmstrongACER ARM OLV OLV

Fast growing var narrow upright form yellow /orange colour in Autumn reaches 
5m

Acer x freemanii Jeffers RedACER FREJ OLV OLV

A fast growing tree with green leaves turning red in autumn. Hardy. Ht. 4m. 
Deciduous.

Aesculus indicaAESC IND OLV OLV

A magnificent large tree with upright spikes of white blush pink flowers in 
spring. Ht. 2m. Deciduous.

Alnus cordataALNU COR OLV OLV

Fresh green foliage in summer with yellow autumn colour. Fast growing. Hardy. 
Will stand wet. Ht. 4m. Deciduous.

Apodasmia similisAPOD SIMI OLV OLV

The upright formal appearance and distinctive foliage combine to make this a 
striking plant, good planted in groups. Naturally grows in wet conditions, but will 
tolerate dry soils.

Austroderia richardii (Cortaderia richardii)AUST RIC OLV OLV

Feather-like flowers November to January. Hardy. Native. Ht 2m. Evergreen.

Betula pendula Wades GoldenBETU WAD OLV OLV

A small growing Birch with golden yellow stems making a special display in 
winter when the bare branches look at their best. Great golden autumn colour. 
Ht.3m. Deciduous.

Betula utilis var. Jacquemontii 'Dazzler'BETU DAZZ OLV OLV

A fast growing, upright, decidious tree with beautiful snow-white bark with 
glossy, deep-green leaves that become yellow in autumn.

Bidens ferulifolia RockstarBID FER ROC 09 9

A compact, rounded perennial that forms a mass display of large yellow 
flowers. Ht 30cm. Great for containers.

Carex sectaCARE SEC OLV OLV

A handsome clump forming green grass. Seed heads dark brown. Likes damp 
sites. Ht. 1m.

Carpodetus serratusCARPO SER OLV OLV

Dark green leaves with light marbling on surface. Masses of small white flowers 
cover tree. Very hardy and reasonably quick growing. Ht 4m. Evergreen.

Castanea sativaCAST SAT OLV OLV

A handsome shade tree, growing in any well drained soil. Edible nuts. Ht 6m. 
Deciduous.

Cordyline australisCORD AUS OLV OLV

New Zealands hardy palm with creamy white scented summer flowers. Ht 3m. 
Evergreen.
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Cortaderia toitoiCORT TOI OLV OLV

Largest endemic grass found in NZ Feather-like flower heads up to 2m high 
produced from November to March. Very hardy. Ht 2m. Evergreen.

Cryptomeria japonica Elegans CompactaCRYP ECO OLV OLV

Green foliage in summer changes to bronze in winter. Hardy, bushy conifer. Ht. 
2m. Evergreen.

Cupressus arizonicaCUPR ARI OLV 1L

An open growing small tree with grey green foliage. Very hardy and wind 
resistant. Used for shelter. Ht 5m. Evergreen. Conifer.

Elaeagnus x ebbingeiELAE EBB OLV OLV

Hardy fast growing upright shrub with large silvery green leaves. Highly scented 
flowers in autumn/early winter. Great for hedging in sun or shade. Wind, cold & 
salt tolerant. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen

Enkianthus campanulatusENKI CAM OLV OLV

Clusters of red fringed flowers in spring. Outstanding autumn colour.NO LIME. 
Ht. 2m. Deciduous.

Eucalyptus nitensEUCA NIT OLV OLV

The fastest growng Gum. Used for shelter. Large grey green leaves when 
young. Ht.6m. Evergreen.

Eucryphia l. Gilt EdgeEUCR LGI OLV OLV

A small upright tree with lovely white flowers in summer. Foliage edged gold. 
Ht. 2m. Evergreen.

Griselinia littoralisGRIS LIT OLV OLV

Shiny attractive foliage. Very hardy. Ht 2.5m. Evergreen. Native.

Griselinia littoralis CanterburyGRIS LITC OLV OLV

Shiny smaller pointed green, attractive foliage. Ideal specimen for hedging. 
Very hardy. Ht 2m. Evergreen. Native.

Gypsophila Bristol FairyGYPS FAI 090 150

Highly sought after cut flower.Double white flowers in summer.Plant in a sunny 
position.Ht 1m. Deciduous.

Gypsophila rosea Rosy VeilGYPS ROSV 090 150

Collected from a garden in Te Anau. Masses of rose pink flowers.

Ilex crenata ConvexaILEX CON 090 090

A real gem for the rock garden. Great for low hedges. Green leaves all year. Ht. 
50cm. Evergreen. Female

Juncus edgariaeJUNC EDG OLV OLV

Upright rush for damp areas.  Grows from the coast to inland areas.  Ht 75cm

Juncus pallidusJUNC PAL OLV OLV

Strong growing rush, forming dense clumps of pale blue green foliage.  It is 
better suited to larger scale plantings in wetlands and riparian areas.

Laurus nobilisLAUR NOB OLV OLV

Aromatic foliage used in cooking, pyramidal tree or shrub. Stands trimming. 
Thrives in coastal conditions. Ht 2m. Evergreen.

Lavandula angustifolia Blue MountainLAVA BLU 090 9

Blue flowers during summer. Well drained soil, full sun. Used for hedging, 
potpouri, lavender bags, cut flowers, dried decorations and lavender oil. Ht 
50cm.

Leptospermum ScopariumLEPT SCO OLV OLV

Upright plant with white flowers. (Manuka)

Phormium cookianumPHOR COO OLV OLV

A fine native with attractive green pendant leaves. Hardy. Ht. 1.5m. Evergreen.

Wednesday, 20 March 2024 Page 30 of 44



Stock NameStock Code Container

Phormium tenaxPHOR TEN OLV OLV

A fine native with attractive green pendant leaves. Hardy. Ht. 1m. Evergreen.

Pittosporum eugenoidesPITT EUG OLV OLV

A native with dark twigs and glossy green oblong leaves. Hardy. Ht 4m. 
Evergreen.

Pittosporum tenuifoliumPITT TEN OLV OLV

Delightful small tree. Slender shape and pyramidal form. Fragrant flowers. Can 
be trimmed to any desirable size. Ht 3m. Evergreen. Native.

Populus CrowsnestPOPU CRO OLV OLV

Tall and stately like the Lombardy Poplar. Very hardy.

Populus kawaPOPU KAW OLV OLV

This strong fast growing tree makes a great shelter and shade tree.  Its Autumn 
golden yellow colours are attractive. Good for soil conservation and as single 
row shelter belt. Fast growing. 10 m at 10 years.

Populus LombardyPOPU LOM OLV OLV

An upright tree making a great shelter tree.  Ht 5m

Populus yunnanensisPOPU YUN OLV OLV

Broadly columnar is habit.  New growth is a lovely red turing to dark green as it 
matures.  Scented when coming into leaf.  Decidious Ht 5m

Quercus cerrisQUER CER OLV OLV

One of the toughest oaks. The small acorns are ideal for wildlife food. Fast 
growing tree with lobed leaves. Excellent on chalky soils and the coast. Ht. 6m. 
Deciduous.

Soleirolia soleirolii (Syn Helxine)SOLE SOL 090 9

Masses of tiny green leaves cover this lovely indoor plant.Flat growing, great for 
hanging baskets.

Sophora Quick SilverSOPH QUI 090 9

Hybrid Kowhai with handsome grey foliage, the golden flowers are attractive to 
Bellbirds and Tui.

Teucrium fruticansTEUC FRU 090 9

A low spreading shrub with grey green leaves producing Rosemary like flowers 
in summer and autumn. Hardy. HT 1m.

Thuja occ. RheingoldTHUJ RHE 090 9

A dwarf semi-prostrate conifer. The golden foliage changes to rich golden 
brown in winter. Ht 1m. Evergreen.

Thuja occidentalis EricoidesTHUJ OER 090 9

Soft compact evergreen deep green in summer colouring to deep bronze in 
winter. Ht. 1m

Viburnum tinus Bewleys VariegataVIBU TVA OLV OLV

Elegant variegated shiny leaves dense shrub with white flushed pink flowers in 
bunches in early spring. Ht 2m. Evergreen.

Viburnum tinus Eve PriceVIBU TEV OLV OLV

Compact hardy shrub with carmine buds opening white tinged pink in winter. A 
most attractive shrub for hedges or the garden. Ht. 1.5m. Evergreen.

Viburnum tinus GwenllianVIBU TING OLV OLV

Dwarf compact shrub with clusters of white flowers, pink in the bud, in early 
spring. Very hardy. Ht. 1m. Evergreen.

Viburnum tinus LucidumVIBU TINL OLV OLV

Buds appear in autumn opening to white in late winter. Compact. Very hardy. Ht 
2m. Evergreen.

Tall Trees
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Acer Beni HineACER BENI 25 25L

Acer Palmatum Beni Heni.  Dwarf red Maple.  Bright spring foliage matures to a 
copper bronze-green in summer.  Orange red in Autumn.

Acer buergeranumACER BUE 25 25L

Small, bushy tree with three lobed leaves, green in summer turning orange in 
autumn. Hardy in the garden. Ht. 3m. Deciduous.

Acer campestreACER CAM 25 25L

Yellow to red foliage in autumn. A medium sized tree.

Acer capillipesACER CAPI 25 25L

Young growths coral red. Leaves reliably tinted bright red in autumn. Silvery 
green Snake like bark. Hardy modest vase shaped tree. Ht. 2.5m. Deciduous. 
AGM

Acer cappadocicumACER CAP 25 25L

Lobed glossy green leaves turning rich butter yellow in autumn. Hardy. Ht 4m. 
Deciduous

Acer cappadocicum rubrumACER CAPR 25 25L

New growth red in spring. Lobed glossy green leaves in summer turning rich 
butter yellow in autumn. Hardy. Ht 3m. Deciduous

Acer henryiACER HEN 25 25L

Small shade tree.  Bronze new leaves turn green, stunning autumn leaves of 
red and yellow.  Long chains of green seed capsules in summer.  Protect from 
strong winds.  Deciduous.

Acer negunda VariegataACER NVA 35 35L

Leaves broad with irregular white margins, young leaves pink in spring. Ht. 3m.

Acer negunda ViolaceumACER NEGV 25 25L

Young shoots purple. Fast growing tree with bronze green leaves turning gold 
in autumn. Ht. 3m. Deciduous. In the spring beautiful long tassels are produced.

Acer oliverianum ssp formosanumACER OLIF 25 25L

A broadly spreading tree.  Larger leaves than Acer palmatum.  Autumn colours 
are crimson-bronze.  Very raw tree in NZ.  Ht 8m

Acer p. AratamaACER PALA 25 25L

Sturdy, dwarf red leaved Maple with bright scarlet foliage with green veins. Ht. 
1.5m. Deciduous.

Acer p. AtropurpureumACER ATR 25 25L

Deep purple leaves in summer turning bright red in autumn. Must have shelter 
from wind. Ht 2m. Deciduous

Acer p. D. Crimson Queen.ACER DISCQ 25 25L

Deep red foliage all summer turning deeper in autumn. Must have shelter from 
wind. Ht 1m. Weeping deciduous.

Acer p. dissectum OrangeolaACER ORAN 25 25L

An attractive form with smaller, rounded foliage.  Spring foliage is orange-red 
turning to bronze-red with green undertones in summer.  Ht. 3m

Acer p. dissectum TamukeyamaACER PDIST 25 25L

Vigorous weeping maple.  Excellent deep red purple dissected foliage.  Fiery 
scarlet autumn tones.

Acer p. FireglowACER FIR 25 25L

A vigorous, upright well branched shrub or small tree. New leaves emerge very 
bright pink red, turning a deep red in summer. Autumn foliage red. Ht. 4m. 
Deciduous.

Acer p. Skeeter's BroomACER SKE 25 25L

A dwarf sport from Bloodgood. Young leaves bright red tuning deep purple in 
summer and deeper in autumn. A narrow upright dwarf shrub to 2m. Deciduous.
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Acer pal. Villa TarantoACER VIL 25 25L

Light green and a reddish overtone to the leaves makes for a very dainty small 
tree. Ht. 2.5m. Deciduous.

Acer palmatum BloodgoodACER PBLO 25 25L

Purple Japanese Maple. Small rounded tree with deep red foliage throughout 
summer. Shelter from wind. Ht. 4-5.m. Deciduous.

Acer palmatum ButterflyACER BUT 25 25L

Deciduous small tree, vriegated foliage irregularly margined with silvery-white 
and light touches of pink on the edges in spring.  2.5m

Acer palmatum Coonara PygmyACER COO 25 25L

Dense and bushy, pale pink and green colours emerge in spring, then green in 
summer, orange and yellow in autumn, accented with splashes of red.  Full sun 
to part shade with well drained soil.

Acer palmatum Dissectum ViridisACER DISV 25 25L

Weeping green foliage with beautiful orange autumn foliage. Protect from wind. 
A beautiful specimen tree or for a formal setting. Ht. 1m.

Acer palmatum Japanese SunriseACER PJAP 25 25L

Small lime green leaves that darken in summer, then yellow in Autumn. Bark 
colour can range from yellow to red depending on the time of year and age. 
H:4m

Acer palmatum Kandy KitchenACER KAN 25 25L

A dwarf red upright form, with a very compact and layered look. Bright red new 
shoots constrast nicely with the mature foliage, which is rich green, tinged 
purple. Stems short with purple bark. Autumn colour bright red. Ht. 1.5m. 
Deciduous.

Acer palmatum KatsuraACER PKAT 25 25L

A small tree with striking spring foliage of pale yellow, glowing orange, and red. 
Green in summer. Orange in autumn.

Acer palmatum MoonfireACER PMOO 25 25L

Upright shrub or small tree.  Dark reddish-purple turning bright crimson red in 
the autumn, flowers in spring, grows berries iin Autumn.  H 2.5m

Acer palmatum OsakazukiACER OSA 25 25L

Bronze green foliage in summer turning intense crimson in autumn. Shelter 
from wind. Ht. 3m.

Acer palmatum Peaches and CreamACER PEA 25 25L

'variegated white, pink and green foliage, protect from afternoon sun for best 
colour.  H 2.5m

Acer palmatum Red EmperorACER REDE 25 25L

Large deep rich burgundy-purple leaves that glow red. Autumn tones vibrant 
glowing red. An upright branching vigorous grower to 7m. Deciduous.

Acer palmatum SenkakiACER SEN 25 25L

Magnificent orange autumn colour that holds well with striking, vivid coral red 
branches in winter. Attractive lime green spring foliage. Ht 2.5m

Acer platanoides ColumnareACER PLAC 25 25L

A narrow  tree with a strong upright habit making a great columnar tree. Large 
five lobed deep green leaves turn yellow in autumn.  Excellent for use on 
avenues. Deciduous Ht. 7m

Acer platanoides PalmatifidumACER PLAP 25 25L

A hardy tree with deeply dissected dense green foliage.  Greenish-yellow 
flowers in spring. Ht 4m.

Acer pseudo. Prinz HandjeryACER PRI 25 25L

A small slow growing tree leaves purple tinged beneath in spring. Ht. 2m. 
Deciduous.
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Acer pseudoplatanus BrilliantissimumACER BRIL 25 25L

Young growths coral pink turning green and yellow in summer. Must have 
shelter from wind. Ht 2m. Deciduous

Acer pseudoplatanus WorleeiACER WORL 25 25L

'Golden Sycamore' Medium sized tree. Leaves soft yellow-green at first then 
golden, finally green. Raised in Germany before 1893.

Acer r. Red SunsetACER RUBR 25 25L

An upright form of rubrum with good autumn colour. Likes well drained soils. 
Ht.5m.

Acer rubrum BlythewoodACER RUBBL 25 25L

A rubrum variety selected by Ross Stuart in the early 1950.s  Ht 5m  Masses of 
red Autumn colour.

Acer rubrum BowhallACER RUBB 25 25L

Broadly columnar tree with spectacular colours of red. orange and yellow in 
Autumn.Deciduous 5m

Acer rubrum BrandywineACER RUBW 25 25L

Neat upright bright green shade tree.  In autumn the leaves turn brilliant red and 
burgundy making this one of the best early autumn displays.  Ht.5m.

Acer rubrum ColumnareACER RUBC 25 25L

An upright form on rubrum with good autumn colour. Likes well drained soils. 
Ht.5m.

Acer rubrum October GloryACER RUBO 25 25L

Dark green leaves in autumn turning brilliant red. Hardy. Ht 5m Deciduous

Acer saccharumACER SAC 25 25L

Hardy tree for any garden. Green leaves turn crimson to orange in Autumn. 5m. 
Deciduous

Acer tataricum v. ginnalaACER TATG 25 25L

A large shrub or small tree of spreading habit.  The leaves are dull, pale green 
and doubly-toothed.  Brilliant autumn colour. A tough little maple used for 
shelter in some counties

Acer tetramerumACER TET 25 25L

Acer x freemanii ArmstrongACER ARM 25 25L

Fast growing var narrow upright form yellow /orange colour in Autumn reaches 
5m

Acer x freemanii Jeffers RedACER FREJ 25 25L

A fast growing tree with green leaves turning red in autumn. Hardy. Ht. 4m. 
Deciduous.

Aesculus carnea BriotiiAESC BRI 25 25L

Deep pink flowers in late spring on a compact tree. Hardy. Ht. 5m.

Aesculus hippocastanumAESC HIP 25 25L

Impressive large tree with large cut leaves all summer. Hardy. White flowers in 
early summer. Ht. 5m. Deciduous.

Aesculus splendensAESC SPL 25 25L

Long panicles of red flowers in summer on a shrubby tree. Hardy. Ht. 2.5m. 
Deciduous.

Apple BallaratMALU BALL 25 25L

A heritage apple dating back to early 1900 Australia, bearing large sweet fruit. 
Great for cooking and keeps well.

Apple Blue Mt CollegeMALU BMC 25 25L

Large crisp eating Apple
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Apple Bramley's SeedlingMALU BRAM 25 25L

Mid season dessert apple that is crisp and juicy with good flavour. Ht: 3m. 
Deciduous ( Semi Dwarf )

Apple DiscoveryMALU DIS 25 25L

High health eating Apple early / mid season.

Apple FujiAPPL FUJ 25 25L

New popular eating Apple. Very good keeper. Medium size pink spriped over 
green yellow skin, sweet.

Apple Golden DeliciousMALU GOLD 25 25L

Great taste, texture, aroma, and appearance. Honeyed flavour. Very Sweet 
when tree ripened. Self fertile. Late season. AGM. Deciduous.  Ht. 3m.

Apple Golden Delicious Semi-DwarfAPPL GODSD 25 25L

Great taste, texture, aroma, and appearance. Honeyed flavour. Very Sweet 
when tree ripened. Self fertile. Late season. AGM. Deciduous

Apple Granny Smith EspalieredAPPL GSE 25 25L

Late, large green crisp juicy white fleshed fruit, desert and cooking.  Deciduous

Apple GraversteinAPPL GRA 25 25L

Apple crisp and juicy with good flavour Ht 3m. Deciduous

Apple Kentish FillbasketMALU KENF 25 25L

Orange pippin cv. Old English type with large cooking apples that are streaked 
red. Very edible fruit. Height 3m.

Apple Lady in RedAPPL LAD 25 25L

This apple has fruit that is pink-red blushed with pure white flesh and is capable 
of producing fruit that meets the high quality standards of PINK LADY® apples, 
one of the world's most popular varieties.

Apple LoboMALU LOB 25 25L

Large red eating Apple. Also good for cooking and juicing. Mid season.

Apple Montys SurpriseMALU MONS 25 25L

Very large cooking apple, one of the best for pies and other culinary delights.

Apple Montys Surprise Semi DwarfAPPL MOSSD 25 25L

Very large cooking apple, one of the best for pies and other culinary delights.

Apple Peasgood NunsuchMALU PEA 25 25L

Good proven cooking apple. Moderate height. ( Semi Dwarf )

Apple PrimaMALU PRIM 25 25L

High health Apple with clean fruit good mid season eating Apple.

Apple Red DeliciousMALU REDL  25 25L

Red Delicious is a heart-shaped fruit with a striking bright red skin that is 
sometimes striped. The flesh is crunchy and very juicy with a mild, sweet 
flavour.

Apple Red Delicious Semi DwarfAPPL RDSD 25 25L

Red Delicious is a heart-shaped fruit with a striking bright red skin that is 
sometimes striped. The flesh is crunchy and very juicy with a mild, sweet 
flavour.

Apple Royal GalaMALU ROY 25 25L

Early eating Apple. Crisp and juicy with good flavour. Ht 3m. Deciduous

Apple SplendourMALU SPL 25 25L

Good proven Central Otago eating apple. Moderate height. Bright Red over 
yellow fruit, sweet juicy flesh.  Good keeper.

Atherosperma moschatumATHE MOS 25 25L

Small Tasmanian tree, with fragrant cream flowers in summer. Ht 4m. 
Evergreen.
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Betula ermanii PolarBETU POL 25 25L

Pearly white trunks form a slender upright tree. Butter yellow autumn colours. A 
recent selection from John McLaren.  Ht. 5m. Deciduous.

Betula pendula LacineataBETU LAC 25 25L

Cut Leaf Birch. Attractive all year round.Tall slim yellow autumn colour. Ht 4m. 
Deciduous

Betula pendula TristisBETU TRI 25 25L

Tree of moderate size with bright yellow autumn colour. Lovely white trunk, with 
dainty weeping branches.  Hardy. Ht. 5m. Deciduous.

Betula pendula Wades GoldenBETU WAD 25 25L

A small growing Birch with golden yellow stems making a special display in 
winter when the bare branches look at their best. Great golden autumn colour. 
Ht.3m. Deciduous.

Betula utilis jacquemontiiBETU JAC 25 25L

Beautiful white peeling bark and yellow autumn colour. One of the best for white 
trunks and at last being recognised. Hardy and easily grown. Ht. 5m. Deciduous

Carpinus betulus FastigiataCARP BETF 25 25L

A neat medium upright tree with grey fluted trunk and oval ribbed leaves. This 
hardy tree retains its brown leaves over winter when young. Ht 5m. Deciduous.

Cercidiphyllum japonicumCERC JAP 25 25L

Bright green leaves turning yellow in autumn. Moist well drained soils.  Fragrant 
as the leaves fall in the Autumn. Ht. 3m. Deciduous.

Cercis canadensis Forest PansyCERC FOR 25 25L

Small round headed tree with vivid purple foliage and pink flowers in spring. 
Likes sun and shelter. Ht. 3m.

Cherry Compact StellaCHER COMS 25 25L

Self fertile fruiting cherry with large sweet fruits in summer. Hardy. Ht. 3m. 
Deciduous.

Cherry DawsonCHER DAW 25 25L

Delicious eating cherry with firm red flesh encased in rich black skin.  Fruit is of 
medium size, tree habit is upright and spreading.

Cherry MontmorencyCHER MONT 25 25L

Most popular tart cherry in the USA. Many culinary uses including the traditional 
American cherry pie. Round, red fruit with white flesh. Self fertile, also a good 
pollinator. H: 4m x 4m.

Cherry TangshiCHER TAN 25 25L

Upright, small rounded tree. Self fertile. Red fruit with yellow flesh. White 
flowers. H: 3m x 2.5m Deciduous.

Cornus florida Cherokee ChiefCORN CHE 25 25L

Flowers in early summer of white bracts. Beautiful autumn colour. Ht. 2.5m. 
Deciduous.

Cornus florida Cherokee PrincessCORN CHEP 25 25L

Low branching, broadly - pyramidal form. Glossy, light green leaves turn a firey 
blend of orange and red in autumn. White flowers in mid spring.

Cornus florida Cherokee SunsetCORN CHES 25 25L

Dark green leaves edged lemon yellow in summer.  Brilliant autumn colour.  Ht 
2.5m.  Deciduous.

Cornus florida Cloud 9CORN CLO 25 25L

Prolific pure white flowers in summer. Rounded spreading bush. Likes sunny 
garden. Ht. 2.5m. Deciduous.

Cornus florida DaybreakCORN DAY 25 25L

Green leaves with creamy white margins. Large white bracts. Pink and purple 
autumn tones. Ht. 3m. Deciduous.
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Cornus florida Purple GloryCORN PUR 25 25L

A purple foliaged tree with the leaves becoming a black-purple in autumn 
before falling.  Red spring flowers are long lasting and showy.  Large shrub or 
small tree with spreading branches.  Height 4m

Cornus florida RainbowCORN RAI 25 25L

Pink. cream, and green leaves all summer. White flowers in spring. Ht.2m. 
Deciduous.

Cornus GreenvaleCORN GRE 25 25L

A vigorous tree with large creamy white flowers in early summer. In our trials of 
hardy dogwoods this tree has out performed all others. Raised in Greenvale by 
Mrs L Paterson. New 2004. Evergreen with some autumn colour as well. PVR

Cornus kousa chinensisCORN KOUC 25 25L

A great small tree for southern gardens. Cream flowers from October to late 
December, then strawberry fruit and rusty red autumn colour. Ht 3m

Cornus kousa DoubloonCORN DOU 25 25L

Outstanding slender tree with creamy white flowers in late spring. Ht. 4m. 
Deciduous.

Cornus kousa 'Elizabeth Lustgarten'CORN ELI 25 25L

Small pendulous tree bearing the traditional creamy/white starry flowers in early 
summer.

Cornus kousa Milky WayCORN KMIL 25 25L

Vigorous grower. Becomes smothered with large, flat, four petalled white 
flowers in Summer. Leaves turn shades of purple and red in Autumn. Also 
produces strawberry-like fruit which the birds love! H:4m

Cornus kousa RainbowCORN KRAI 25 25L

White spring flowers on brilliant yellow foliage with green base. Autumn rainbow 
display includes pink and deep purple. 2.5m

Cornus kousa SatomiCORN KOUS 25 25L

Salmon red blooms in early summer. Good red autumn colour. Ht. 3.5m. 
Deciduous.

Cornus kousa Southern CrossCORN KOUSO 25 25L

Creamy white flowers in early summer. Bright red autumn foliage. Ht. 2.5m. 
Deciduous.

Cornus kousa XanthocarpumCORN XAN 25 25L

Selection with yellow instead of red fruits.  An upright bushy small tree or large 
shrub with white/cream flowers. Leaves are light green turning yellow in 
Autumn. Birds enjoy fruit (strawberries).  Ht 2.5m

Cornus nuttalliiCORN NUT 25 25L

Large white flowers in late spring. Brilliant yellow autumn foliage. HT. 3m.

Corylus avellana White HeartCORY WHI 25 25L

One of the most promising selections for processing. Well filled nuts. Ht 4m.

Corylus BarcelonaCORY BAR 25 25L

Large high quality table nut. Very vigorous bush. Ht. 3m. Deciduous.

Corylus colurnaCORY COL 25 25L

Edible fruit that matures in February.  A small rounded tree that dosent sucker.  
The bark is a pale grey that forms a corky texture.  Ht 3m

Crataegus o. Rosea Flore PlenoCRAT ROS 25 25L

Flowers double pink in late spring. Very hardy small tree. Ht. 3m.

Crataegus x grignonensisCRAT GRI 25 25L

White spring flowers and long lasting bright red berries in autumn. Ht 4m
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Dacrycarpus dacrydiodesDACR DACR 25 25L

A slow growing native, with brown foliage on the juvenile tree, changing to 
green as it gets older.Tolerates wet conditions.Ht 20m

Eucryphia milliganiiEUCR MIL 25 25L

Dark green dainty shining leaves and dainty white pea sized flowers in summer. 
Ht. 1.5m. Evergreen.

Fraxinus excelsiorFRAX EXC 25 25L

Magnificent round headed tree. Ht. 15m. Deciduous.

Fraxinus excelsoir Green GlowFRAX GRG 25 25L

A smaller growing form of ash with a upright rounded form.  A magnificent tree 
for driveways and avenues. Ht. 15m. Deciduous.

Fraxinus ornusFRAX ORN 25 25L

A pretty medium sized tree with abundant flowers in spring. Ht 6m. Deciduous.

Fraxinus pensylvanica CimmzamFRAX PEC 25 25L

A upright erect growing tree with glossy green leaves.  Autumn colours of 
orange, yellow, burgundy and red  which persist well into winter. Tolerant of 
drought and winds. Perfect for lining avenues and driveways. Excellent street 
tree.

Fraxinus RaywoodiiFRAX RAY 25 25L

A graceful compact tree leaves turning claret red in early autumn. Ht 6m. 
Deciduous.

Ginkgo bilobaGINK BIL 25 25L

Upright, rounded form with spectacular deep green leaves, pendant 
appearance. Shelter from wind. Ht. 4m. Grafted female.

Ginkgo biloba Autumn GoldGINK AUT 25 25L

Selected male clone with upright habit and yellow autumn foliage. Shelter from 
wind. Ht. 3m.

Ginkgo biloba FastigiataGINK FAS 25 25L

Amazing vivid yellow autumn colours make a stunning display.  This upright 
groing forms make a coloum of green during the summer in a shelterd area.  Ht 
3m.

Ginkgo biloba SaratogaGINK SAR 25 25L

Upright growing smaller growing selection than suits a smaller garden.  As the 
tree ages it becomes a more rounded headed tree.  It makes an amazing 
display of golden yellow in the autumn.  Ht 2m for health details 
https://www.cognitune.com/ginkgo-biloba-benefits/

Ginkgo Jade ButterfliesGINK JAD 25 25L

Pyramidal tree with fade - green foliage that turns soft cream yellow in autumn.  
Height 3m

Ginkgo Little WeeperGINK LIT 25 25L

A Rare weeping tree.  The branches grow upwards before arching and allowing 
the outer branches to cascade to the ground.

Griselinia littoralis  Dixon's CreamGRIS DIX 25 25L

Cream and green foliage. Native. Plant in shade. Ht. 2m. Evergreen.

Griselinia littoralis LeprecornGRIS LEP 25 25L

Upright growing form with yellow steams and small green leaves.  Makes a 
stunning hedge and can be grown as a screening plant up to 2m

Hamamelis Arnold's PromiseHAMA ARN 25 25L

Yellow flowers in mid winter on a hardy bush. Yellow autumn coloured leaves. 
Ht. 2m. Deciduous.

Hamamelis m. PallidaHAMA PAL 25 25L

Sulphur yellow flowers in mid winter on a hardy spreading compact bush. 
Yellow autumn coloured leaves. Ht. 2m. Deciduous.
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Koelreuteria paniculataKOEL PAN 25 25L

Long cut leaves in summer and brilliant yellow autumn colour. Yellow flowers in 
summer. Ht. 3m. Deciduous.

Kunzea ericoides GreenKUNZ ERI GRE 2 25L

Laburnum alpinum PendulumLABU PEN 25 25L

Hanging yellow pea flowers in late spring. Ideal for small gardens. Ht 2m 
Deciduous

Libocedrus plumosaLIBO PLU 25 25L

Graceful foliaged native for a specimen tree in the garden. Good timber. Ht. 
3m. Evergreen. Conifer.

Liquidamber s. FesteriiLIQU FES 25 25L

A upright growing tree with a narrow erect pyramidal habit. Brilliant burgundy 
autumn leaves which colour better after a hot dry summer and hold on until 
July. Excellent narrow street tree. Ht 6m

Liquidamber styracifluaLIQU STY 25 25L

A beautiful large tree with shining green leaves which turn magnificent crimson 
colours in autumn. Ht 5m. Deciduous.

Liriodendron tulipiferaLIRI TUL 25 25L

Large handsome leaves on an upright tree with fragrant flowers with age. Ht. 
4m. Great displays of butter yellow autumn colours. Deciduous.

Magnolia AtheneMAGN ATH 25 25L

Ivory white with pink, flowers in spring. Protect from wind. PVR. Upright 
growing. HT. 4m. Deciduous.

Magnolia AuroraMAGN AUR 25 25L

Bred in NZ by Os Blumhardt, a cross between ‘Starwars’ and M. sargentiana 
var robusta. Large blooms of rich, deep pink. A columnar tree with upright habit. 
H: 4m x 3m

Magnolia Billowing CloudMAGN BCLO 25 25L

New Zealand breed magnolia. Distinctive white blooms with a soft blush pink 
centre of the flower. Nice purfume. H:3m in 10 years.

Magnolia Brixton BelleMAGN BRI 25 25L

Bred in Brixton, Taranaki. Large, rich pink blooms with a soft inner blush. 
Upright habit. H: 4m x 3.5m. Deciduous.

Magnolia ButterfliesMAGN BUT 25 25L

Large globe shaped flowers of creamy yellow in spring. A new Magnolia.

Magnolia CameoMAGN CAME 25 25L

Elegant sculpted blooms of a rounded form in spring.  The outer side of the 
petals is red-purple, with a white ineer surface flushed red-purple.  Wind 
tolerant blooms are produced in abundance.  H 3m

Magnolia campbellii AlbaMAGN CAMA 25 25L

Large white flowers in early spring. Shelter from wind. Ht. 3m. Deciduous.

Magnolia campbellii Charles RaffillMAGN CAMC 25 25L

Giant pink flowers in early spring.  This is one of the most stunning trees in the 
early spring. Shelter from wind. Ht. 4m. Deciduous.

Magnolia campbellii Sir Harold HellierMAGN SIRH 25 25L

Large cup and sucer shaped flowers of pure white from late winter to early 
spring.  Tree grows to be broadly conical.  H 4m

Magnolia CleopatraMAGN CLEO 25 25L

A small rounded tree with rich purple flowers.  Free flowering from a young 
age.  Prefers moist site, in full sun.  Ht. 4m
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Magnolia denudata GereMAGN DENG 25 25L

Lovely ivory white, simple, elegant goblet shaped blooms. Useful in colder 
climates.

Magnolia GenieMAGN GEN 25 25L

A mass of deep velvety blooms early season - changing through shades of rich 
purple and red.

Magnolia Heaven ScentMAGN HEA 25 25L

Large white and rose flowers in spring. Plant in sheltered position. Ht 2m. 
Deciduous.

Magnolia Koban DoriMAGN KOB 25 25L

Recently introduced yellow Magnolia. Smaller growing than other yellow 
varieties. Excellent colour, flowering with the foliage.

Magnolia LanarthMAGN LAN 25 25L

Large, woolly buds open to reveal large, cupped, deep magenta blooms. Plant 
in a sheltered spot with acidic soil for best results. H: 3m Deciduous.

Magnolia Lennei AlbaMAGN LALB 25 25L

Neat, round headed small tree with goblet shaped pure white blooms with 
recurved petal tips.Deciduous. 4m

Magnolia Old PortMAGN OLDP 25 25L

Flowers appear during spring and are fragrant, large, wine-red with white 
inners.  Foliage is large rich green. H: 3m

Magnolia PristineMAGN PRI 25 25L

white flowers

Magnolia Red AsMAGN REDA 25 25L

Prolific, deep reddish blooms on a smaller growing tree, ideal for a smaller 
garden. Flowers over a long period. Deciduous. 2.5m

Magnolia Royal PurpleMAGN ROYP 25 25L

A small narrow upright tree producing mid sized blooms of bright royal purple. 
Ht. 3m

Magnolia SereneMAGN SER AT 25 25L

Flowers pale inside, deep rose outside in late spring. Shelter from wind. Ht. 4m. 
Deciduous.

Magnolia Star WarsMAGN STA 25 25L

Large pointed pink flowers in spring. Sometimes has an autumn flowering as 
well. One of the hardiest Magnolias. Ht. 5m. Deciduous.

Magnolia stellata ChrysanthemifloraMAGN SCHF 25 25L

A new multi-petaled pink form of the popular Star Magnolia. A bushy shrub with 
attractive silvery buds during winter.  1.5m. Deciduous.

Magnolia stellata DawnMAGN STED 25 25L

Compact growing pink magnolia for a small garden. Ht. 1.5m. Deciduous.

Magnolia stellata Jane PlattMAGN SJP 25 25L

Fully double pink flowers in early spring make a great show on the compact 
bush to 1.5m. A new variety highly recommended overseas.

Magnolia stellata RoseaMAGN STERO 25 25

Pale pink star like flowers in spring. Shelter from wind. Ht. 1.5m. Deciduous.

Magnolia Strawberry FieldsMAGN STR 25 25L

Bright, clear red flowers with broad petals. Medium flower size. Ht: 4m.  NZ 
hybrid from Ian Baldick.

Magnolia SunsationMAGN SUN 25 25L

Green buds open to goblet shaped, yellow flowers with a green tinge and a pink 
flush at the base. Upright, columnar form. H: 4m x 2m. Deciduous.
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Magnolia VulcanMAGN VUL 25 25L

Brilliant ruby red blooms in spring. Protect from wind. The deepest coloured 
magnolia. Ht. 3m. Deciduous. PVR.

Magnolia x brooklynensis WoodsmanMAGN WOO 25 25L

Flowers green inside, purple brown outside in early summer. Shelter from wind. 
Ht. 4m. Deciduous.

Magnolia x loebneri Leonard MesselMAGN LOEL 25 25L

Produces a cloud of lilac pink star flowers in spring. Shelter from wind. One of 
the hardiest forms of Magnolia. Ht. 3m. Deciduous.

Magnolia x loebneri Pink CloudMAGN PINC 25 25L

Large starry blooms of soft rose, deeper on the back paling to white at the tips, 
white when fully matured. Hardy for a Magnolia. Ht. 4m. Deciduous.

Magnolia x soulangiana AlexandrinaMAGN SOUA 25 25L

Pink flowers in spring. Shelter from wind. Ht.3m. Deciduous.

Magnolia Yellow LanternMAGN YELL 25 25L

Large Yellow flowers with pink in the base. Rounded small tree. H 3m in 10 
years.

Malus Autumn GoldMALU AUT 25 25L

Distictive pear shaped fruit in glowing shades of gold. A show of white blossom 
in Spring. A healthy robust grower, great for making Jelly. (PVR)

Malus Big RedMALU BIR 25 25L

Large, rich, dark red fruit with delicious flavour. Perfect snack apple size. White 
blosoms in Spring. (PVR)

Malus Blue MountainMALU BLU 25 25L

Bright pink flowers in late spring on a hardy tall upright tree. Leaves red in 
summer. Edible fruits in autumn are ideal for making jelly. Ht. 3-4m. Deciduous.

Malus FlamingoMALU FLA 25 25L

Double red flower buds open to deep pink flowers in spring. Deep burgundy red 
foliage on an upright tree makes a display in the spring to autumn. A prized 
selection form John McLarens in Central Otago. PVR applied for TRM119.

Malus Golden HornetMALU GOL 25 25L

White flowers in spring with golden yellow fruits in autumn. Ht. 3m. Deciduous.

Malus Jack HummMALU JAC 25 25L

Brilliant white flowered Crab Apple with heavy crops of large red fruits in 
autumn and winter. Often left undisturbed by birds until spring. Good for Jelly. 
Ht. 3m.

Malus Strawberry SwirlMALU STR 25 25L

Larger sized fruit in shades of orange with swirling flecks of red in Autumn. Soft 
white blossoms flushed with pink in Spring. Vigorous, upright grower. Bee & 
bird friendly. Great for jelly. H: 3m+ Deciduous (PVR)

Malus Tom MathewsMALU TOM 25 25L

Vibrant scarlet red flowers in spring with bronze foliage. Dark red fruit in 
autumn. 3m. Deciduous.

Malus Tom's OrangeMALU TOMO 25 25L

An outstanding display of vibrant orange fruit with white blossoms in spring. A 
healthy robust grower, perfect for making Jelly. (PVR)

Malus Wright's ScarletMALU WRI 25 25L

Very large fruit turning crimson in autumn. Hardy. Ht. 3m. Deciduous.

Malus x robustaMALU ROB 25 25L

Popularly, though incorrectly known as 'Siberian Crab', the clones of this 
variable hybrid have white or pinkish flowers and more or less globular, cherry-
like red or yellow fruits without calyces.A M 1957. A G M 1984.
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Mespilus germanicaMESP GER 25 25L

Large white flowers in late spring. Brilliant rusty autumn colour. Edible fruits. Ht 
3m. Deciduous.

Metasequoia glyptostroboides GoldrushMETA GLYG 25 25L

Tall, upright pyramid, golden tree with soft ferny needles. Good autumn colours. 
Enjoys sheltered position with damp soil. Ht. 8mtrs

Metasequoia glyptostroboides Sheridan SpireMETA GSH 25 25L

Give some shelter from wind. Fresh spring foliage turns rich golden bronze in 
late autumn. A great tree for a damp site. Ht 4m. Deciduous.

Metrosideros robustaMETR ROB 25 25L

Small evergreen tree suitable for mild coastal areas leaves dark green thick 
and rounded narrower on juvenile plants Flowers coppery scarlet appearing in 
late summer.

Metrosideros x sub tomentosa SiroccoMETR SIR 25 25L

A natural hybrid of Pohutakawa and Rata, with deep, rich red flowers in 
Summer.Grows well in most conditions but prefers a moist site.Ht 3 m.

Morus nigraMORU NIG 25 25L

A bushy small tree for a sunny warm garden or wall. Black edible fruits.

Peach Blue MountainPEAC BLU 25 25L

A sweet fruiting peach with very juicy flesh. Ripens in Feb / March.

Peach FlamecrestPEAC FLA 25 25L

One of the better old-fashioned peaches.  Good fruit size with excellent texture 
and flavour.  Clingstone.  Golden fruit with a red blush.  Ripens early to mid 
season

Pear ConferencePYRU CON 25 25L

Self fertile. Long handsome brown skinned fruit for dessert or bottling. Mid 
season.

Pear Doyenne do ComicePYRU DOY 25 25L

Large mid season eating Pear. Pollinator Winter Nellis. Ht. 3m. Deciduous.

Pear Packham's TriumphPYRU PAC 25 25L

Large mid season eating Pear. Pollinator W. Bon Chretian. Ht. 3m. Deciduous.

Pear William's Bon ChretienPYRU WIL 25 25L

An excellent dual purpose Pear. Pollinator Winter Nelis or Packham's Triumph. 
Ht. 3m. Deciduous.

Platanus orientalisPLAT ORI 25 25L

A large stately tree with wide spreading branches. Attractive deep lobed leaves. 
Ht. 5m. Deciduous

Platanus x acerifoliaPLAT ACE 25 25L

Handsome tree with a rounded head of bold green leaves all summer and 
ornamental patchwork flaking bark. . Ht. 6m. Deciduous. (syn hispanica)

Plum OmegaPLUM OME 25 25L

A very popular red skinned plum with red flesh. Sweet. Ht 3m. Deciduous. 
Pollinators Billington/Santa Rosa

Prunus AccoladePRUN ACC 35 25L

Semi double rich pink flowers in early spring makes a massed display. Ht 3m. 
Deciduous.

Prunus AmanogawaPRUN AMA 25 25L

Small columnar tree with erect branches covered in spring with semi-double 
shell pink flowers. Ht. 3m.

Prunus campanulata SuperbaPRUN CAMS 25 25L

Earliest to bloom of all cherries. masses of claret red bells in August. Ht. 5m. 
Deciduous.
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Prunus KansanPRUN KAN 25 25L

Spectacular. Large fully double deep pink flowers in Oct. Good autumn colours. 
One of the most frequently planted Cherries. Ht. 5m.

Prunus nigraPRUN NIG 25 25L

A small narrow headed tree in spring covered with fragrant white to pink 
flowers. Ht. 2.5m. Deciduous.

Prunus nipponica 'Ruby'PRUN RUB 25 25L

Compact dwarf  cherry with single pink flowers forming a lovely compact tree

Prunus padusPRUN PAD 25 25L

Small white almond scented flowers in spring on a small upright tree. Hardy. Ht. 
4m. Deciduous.

Prunus Sub. Lorraine's Early BirdPRUN LOB 25 25L

Small dainty tree, white blushed pink blossoms through winter and early 
spring.Good orange red autumn colour,  3m at maturity. Selected seedling from 
Mrs Patterson of Greenvale.

Prunus subhirtella Autumnalis RoseaPRUN AUR 25 25

Compact growth habit with upright-growing branches. Pale pink, semi-double, 
scented flowers in dainty clusters. Red/Orange autumn colour. Great choice for 
smaller gardens. H:4m

Prunus yed. CraigLea RosePRUN YEDCR 25 25L

Masses of showy single rose pink blooms paling to shell pink on the tips. 
Attractive bark. Vigorous and upright. Ht. 6m.

Pyrus calleryana AristocratPYRU ARI 25 25L

An ideal avenue, shade or accent tree. Showy white spring flowers. Strong 
pyramidal growth habit and yellow to red autumn tonings. Ht. 6m

Pyrus calleryana KeaPYRU KEA 25 25L

Gorgeous foliage of glossy green changing to brilliant burgandy and green in 
autumn. Bushy small tree. Hardy. PVR applied for

Pyrus Communis ConcordePYRU CONC 25 25L

'Concorde' is a compact dessert pear, 2.5-8m tall depending upon the 
rootstock. Flowers white, fruit green

Pyrus communis 'Seckel'PYRU SEC 25 25L

A smaller cultivar, believed to have originated in Philadelphia. Very sweet, fine 
grained fruit. Can be eaten fresh or cooked. If picked early, they will store well, 
up to 5 months. Cold hardy and frost resistant. H: 3m

Pyrus HeratagePYRU HERT 25 25L

150 yr old Pear Tree.

Pyrus salicifolia PendulaPYRU PEN 25 25L

Small pendulous tree for the garden. Plant in open but sheltered position. Ht 
3m. Deciduous.

Pyrus Taylor's GoldPYRU TAYL 25 25L

Taylors Gold is a natural mutation of  Doyenne du Comice. Its cinnamon-
coloured skin covers creamy, tender flesh with richly fragrant white flavour.

Quercus cerrisQUER CER 25 25L

One of the toughest oaks. The small acorns are ideal for wildlife food. Fast 
growing tree with lobed leaves. Excellent on chalky soils and the coast. Ht. 6m. 
Deciduous.

Quercus cocciniaQUER COC 25 25L

A large tree with glistening green leaves in summer turning magnificent red in 
autumn. One of the finest trees for autumn colour. Ht 5m. Deciduous.

Quercus ellipsoidalisQUER ELL 25 25L

A medium tree with a short trunk and wide spreading head. Deeply lobed 
leaves turn crimson in autumn. Ht. 5m. Deciduous.
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Quercus palustrisQUER PAL 25 25L

Glossy green leaves turning bright red in autumn. Handsome specimen tree. 
Ht. 5m. Deciduous.

Quercus roburQUER ROB 25 25L

A large long lived tree developing a broad head with rugged branches. Ht 6m. 
Deciduous.

Quercus robur FastigiataQUER FAS 25 25L

An upright grower, making an imposing specimen. Hardy. Holds its leaves well 
into the winter. Ht. 6m. Deciduous.

Quercus rubraQUER RUB 25 25L

A large tree with glistening green leaves in summer turning magnificent red in 
autumn. One of the finest trees for autumn colour. Ht 5m. Deciduous.

Sophora mac Sun KingSOPH SUN 25 25L

Small deep green tree.In spring through summer, it has a display of yellow 
flowers which attract bellbirds and tuis.

Sophora molloyi Dragons GoldSOPH DRA 25 25L

Yellow flowers on a small,bushy native in spring. Hardy. Attractive to bellbirds 
and tuis. Ht. 1.5m. Evergreen.

Sorbus Apricot SunsetSORB APR 25 25L

A Blue Mountain selection.  First release this season (2008).  Hardy small tree 
with large bunches of apricot coloured autumn berries. Beautiful autumn 
colours. Ht. 4m. Deciduous    Few only.

Sorbus ariaSORB ARI 25 25L

Compact tree with white under leaves turning gold russet in autumn with 
crimson berries. Takes wind. Ht 6m. Deciduous.

Sorbus sargenteanaSORB SAR 25 25L

Very red autumn colour. Upright growing small tree.

Sorbus scalarisSORB SCA 25 25L

Dark glossy frond-like leaves turning rich red in autumn. Bunches of red fruits. 
Ht 4m. Deciduous.

Sorbus x kewensisSORB KEW 25 25L

Large bunches of orange red berries in autumn. Hardy small tree with fern like 
leaves. Ht. 2.5m. Deciduous.
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