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Rhodo Alpine MeadowRHOD ALP 090 9 $5.44

A dwarf compact plant with soft attractive fuzzy green leaves 
and early creamy white flowers. Give some shelter when 
flowering. Evergreen.

63056

Rhodo Apple BrandyRHOD APP 090 9 $5.44

Pink buds maturing to cream flowers in Oct.  Neat bushy plant 
with silvery green new growth maturing to deep forest green.  
Ht 1m.

63063

Rhodo Baden BadenRHOD BAD 090 9 $5.44

Vigorous compact bush  wider than high. Deep cherry red 
flowers in Oct. Ht 75cm. Evergreen.

63067

Rhodo Black SportRHOD BLAS 09 9 $5.44

Very dark crimson purple flowers with a black eye flowering in 
Nov. Vigorous upright bush. Ht 2m. Evergreen.

63082

Rhodo BunaRHOD BUN 090 9 $5.44

Rich, biscuity-yellow flowers open from peachy-cream buds in 
Oct. Well formed trusses. Dense, mounding habit and deep 
green foliage. Ht 1.2m. Evergreen.

63126

Rhodo ChionoidesRHOD CHI 090 9 $5.44

White flowers with a lemon yellow blotch in Oct. Ht 1.5m. 
Evergreen.

63178

Rhodo Christmas CheerRHOD CHR 090 9 $5.44

Pink flowers in early spring and winter. Compact bush. Ht 
1.5m. Evergreen.

63170

Rhodo CornubiaRHOD COR 09 9 $5.44

Bright red flowers in Sept. Upright grower. Ht 2.5m. Evergreen.63217

Rhodo Cream CrestRHOD CRCR 0 9 $5.44

Upright plant with small leaves, bearing beautiful dainty cream 
flowers in late Sept. NO LIME. Ht. 1m. Evergreen.

61654

Rhodo Cunningham's WhiteRHOD CUN 090 9 $5.44

Buds of flush pink open to masses of smaller flowers of white 
with a pale yellow centre. Late Oct flowering. Evergreen. Ht 
2m

63516
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Rhodo Elizabeth HobbieRHOD ELIH 09 9 $5.44

Scarlet red flowers in early Oct on a compact bush. NO LIME. 
Ht 1m. Evergreen.

63249

Rhodo Gomer WatererRHOD GOM 09 9 $5.44

Rose pink buds opening almost white in late Nov. Ht 1.5m. 
Evergreen

63463

Rhodo Helene SchiffnerRHOD HELE 09 9 $5.44

Dark buds open to white flowers, tinged lilac with a faint yellow 
marking in the throat, held in a tight ball truss in October. One 
of the best small neat bushy whites. Ht. 1m.AGM

61876

Rhodo J.P. LadeRHOD JPL 090 9 $5.44

Soft lavender blue flowers in mid season. A hardy bushy 
plant. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen.

63346

Rhodo Jean Marie de MontagueRHOD JEA 090 9 $5.44

The red by which all new reds are judged. Large, scarlet 
flowers in dome-shaped trusses Deep green foliage on a 
compact slow growing  bush. AGM Ht 1.5m. Evergreen.

61504

Rhodo Lavender GirlRHOD LAV 090 9 $5.44

Flowers of pale lavender edged with rosy mauve, paler in 
centre with golden brown spotting. Flowers in Oct. Ht 1.5m. 
Evergreen.

63395

Rhodo Mission BellsRHOD MIS 090 9 $5.44

Pale pink flowers in Oct. Compact bush. NO LIME. Ht 1m. 
Evergreen.

61723

Rhodo NeatoRHOD NEAT 09 9 $5.44

Beautiful cinnamon red indumentum on the deep green 
leaves. White flowers from a pink bud in Nov. Compact. Ht 
1m. Evergreen.

61875

Rhodo Percy WisemanRHOD PER 090 9 $5.44

Showy flowers that are peach-pink and cream, yellow throat 
and green marks in a rounded truss in Oct. Shiny, dark foliage 
on a compact, vigorous plant. Ht 1m.

61568

Rhodo PosyRHOD POS 090 9 $5.44

A compact bush with frilled pink flowers, and good glossy 
leaves in Nov. Ht. 1m. Evergreen.

61887

Rhodo Princess AliceRHOD PRI 090 9 $5.44

Sweetly scented white flowers in Oct. Shelter from heavy 
frost. Ht 1.5m. Evergreen

61607

Rhodo Purple PassionRHOD PURP 0 9 $5.44

An outstanding new introduction with deep, rich purple flowers 
in late midseason and dark green disease-resistant foliage. 
Plants are vigorous, dense and compact. Ht 1.5m

63479

Rhodo repensRHOD REP 090 9 $5.44

Bright blood red flowers in Oct. NO LIME. HT 1m. Evergreen.61809

Rhodo Royal Flush TownhillRHOD RFT 090 9 $5.44

Pink bell shaped flowers in Oct. Upright grower. NO LIME. Ht 
1.5m. Evergreen.

61805

Rhodo Ruby HartRHOD RUBH 0 9 $5.44

Waxy deep red flowers in mid season (Oct), will stand sun. A 
dwarf compact plant with shiny dark green leaves. HT 0.5m 
Evergreen.

61650
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Rhodo SammetglutRHOD SAM 090 9 $5.44

Bright red flowers in late Oct, on a tall bush. Ht.2m. Evergreen.63473

Rhodo Sea-tacRHOD SEAT 09 9 $5.44

Cardinal red flowers in a ball truss. Early Sept flowering. Ht. 1. 
Evergreen.

61886

Rhodo Senator Henry JacksonRHOD SENH 0 9 $5.44

Superb compact plant of with trusses of pure white flowers in 
Oct.  A must for anyone who likes the Yak Hybrids  Ht 1m

61893

Rhodo Shooting StarRHOD SHOS 0 9 $5.44

Heavy flowering, long spires of lavender pink flowers.61658

Rhodo St TudyRHOD STT 090 9 $5.44

Upright shrub more compact in full light covered in lobelia 
blue flowers.

61808

Rhodo UniqueRHOD UNI 090 9 $5.44

In early to mid season the bright pink buds open to a beautiful 
buttery cream.  The compact medium bush has attractive 
oblong leaves.  This classic is a deservedlyvery popularplant. 
Ht. 1.5m.AGM

61775

Rhodo yakushimanum AngelRHOD YAKA 1L 1L $12.17

A compact growing small bush with pink buds opening white 
in late October. Ht 1m. Evergreen.

61685

Rhodo yakushimanum FCCRHOD YAK 1L 1L $12.17

Pink buds open to dainty pink rounded truss, fading slowly to 
white when fully open. Flowers in October. Ht 1m. Evergreen.

61866
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